
RCW 78.44.010  Legislative finding.  The legislature recognizes 
that the extraction of minerals by surface mining is an essential 
activity making an important contribution to the economic well-being 
of the state and nation. It is not possible to extract minerals 
without producing some environmental impacts. At the same time, 
comprehensive regulation of mining and thorough reclamation of mined 
lands is necessary to prevent or mitigate conditions that would be 
detrimental to the environment and to protect the general welfare, 
health, safety, and property rights of the citizens of the state. 
Surface mining takes place in diverse areas where the geologic, 
topographic, climatic, biologic, and social conditions are 
significantly different, and reclamation specifications must vary 
accordingly. Therefore, the legislature finds that a balance between 
appropriate environmental regulation and the production and 
conservation of minerals is in the best interests of the citizens of 
the state.  [1993 c 518 § 2; 1970 ex.s. c 64 § 2.]

Captions—1993 c 518: "Captions used in this act do not 
constitute any part of the law." [1993 c 518 § 41.]

Severability—1993 c 518: "If any provision of this act or its 
application to any person or circumstance is held invalid, the 
remainder of the act or the application of the provision to other 
persons or circumstances is not affected." [1993 c 518 § 43.]

Effective date—1993 c 518: "This act is necessary for the 
immediate preservation of the public peace, health, or safety, or 
support of the state government and its existing public institutions, 
and shall take effect July 1, 1993." [1993 c 518 § 44.]

Certified on 9/1/2023 RCW 78.44.010 Page 1


		2023-11-04T17:50:54-0700
	Electronic transmittal




