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Brief Description:  Establishing the microenterprise development program.

Sponsors:  Representatives Morrell, Campbell, Appleton, Chase, Green, Darneille, Ormsby,
O'Brien, Kelley, Moeller, Goodman and Flannigan.

Brief Summary of Bill

• Creating the Microenterprise Development program.

Hearing Date:  1/29/07

Staff:  Tracey Taylor (786-7196).

Background:

Depending on the program, microenterprises are usually defined as small businesses that employ
10 or less, or five or less employees.  Microenterprise development programs are usually tailored
to meet the needs of specific target groups such as welfare recipients, the working poor, rural
businesses, or individuals or business sectors that for various reasons lack access to credit.
Microenterprise development uses a variety of strategies, including poverty alleviation, human
development and economic development, to assist these smallest of businesses.  There are a
variety of types of microenterprise partners including community development corporations, loan
funds, community action agencies, women's organizations, community development banks and
credit unions, housing and social service programs and all levels of government.

Summary of Bill:

The Microenterprise Development Program is created and will be administered by the
Department of Community, Trade and Economic Development (DCTED).  The intent of the
program is to assist microenterprises in job creation by increasing the training, technical
assistance and financial resources available to microenterprises.

This analysis was prepared by non-partisan legislative staff for the use of legislative members
in their deliberations. This analysis is not a part of the legislation nor does it constitute a
statement of legislative intent.
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The DCTED shall provide organization support to a statewide microenterprise association
(Association).  The Association will be a nonprofit entity with microenterprise development
organizations as members.  The Association will serve as an intermediary between the DCTED
and the local microenterprise organizations.  In addition, the DCTED will contract with the
Association for the delivery of services and the distributions of grants.

The DCTED must provide funds for capacity building for the Association and for microenterprise
development organizations throughout the state.  A microenterprise development organization is
defined as a nonprofit development organization, a nonprofit social services organization or other
locally operated nonprofit entity that provides services to low-income entrepreneurs.  The DCTED
must identify and facilitate the availability of state, federal and private sources of funds to
enhance the development of microenterprises in the state.

Along with the Association, the DCTED shall develop the grant criteria for the distribution of
grant funding to microenterprise development organizations.  This criteria may include:  the
geographic representation of all regions of the state, including urban and rural areas; the ability of
the microenterprise development organizations to provide business development services in low-
income communities; the scope of services offered by the microenterprise organization as well as
the level of efficiency in the delivery of services; the ability of the organization to monitor the
progress of its customers and identify technical and financial assistance needs; the ability of the
organization to work with other organizations, public entities, and financial institutions to meet
the technical and financial needs of its customers; and the sufficiency of operating funds for the
microenterprise development organization.  The Association and any microenterprise
development organization receiving grant funds must raise and contribute an amount equal to 25
percent of the Microenterprise Development Program funds received.  These matching funds may
come from private foundations, federal or local sources, financial institutions, or any other
sources other than funds appropriated by the Legislature.

In addition, the DCTED may provide loans to microenterprise revolving loan funds to make
microloans exclusively to low-income microentrepreneurs.  The DCTED may also provide loans
to a guarantee fund from which local microenterprise development organizations may guarantee
loans made by financial institutions to microenterprises.  The guarantee fund may be operated by
the Association or any other private or public entity the DCTED determines has the requisite
expertise.

An annual accounting and report from the Association is required.  It must include outcome
measures required by the DCTED.

The DCTED is authorized to adopt any rules necessary to implement this act.

Appropriation:  None.

Fiscal Note:  Requested on January 22, 2007.

Effective Date:  The bill takes effect 90 days after adjournment of session in which bill is passed.
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