Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

WSR 22-02-040
PROPOSED RULES

BUILDING CODE COUNCIL
[Filed December 30, 2021, 10:05 a.m.]

Original Notice.

Preproposal statement of inquiry was filed as WSR 21-07-134.

Title of Rule and Other Identifying Information: Chapter 51-50
WAC, Adoption and amendment of the 2021 International Building Code
(IBC) .

Hearing Location(s): On February 11, 2022, at 10:00 [a.m.], and
March 11, 2022, at 10:00 [a.m.] virtual meeting - Zoom. In response to
the governor's emergency proclamation there will not be a physical lo-
cation. Please access the meeting via Zoom or conference phone provi-
ded in the agenda.

Date of Intended Adoption: April 15, 2022.

Submit Written Comments to: State Building Code Council (SBCC),
1500 Jefferson Street S.E., Olympia, WA 98504, email sbcc@des.wa.gov,
by March 4, 2022.

Assistance for Persons with Disabilities: Contact Annette Ha-
worth, phone 360-407-3255, email sbccldes.wa.gov, by February 4, 2022.

Purpose of the Proposal and Its Anticipated Effects, Including
Any Changes in Existing Rules: The proposed rule adopts the 2021 edi-
tion of IBC, published by the International Code Council (ICC), with
state amendments to incorporate proposed changes as adopted by SBCC.
The rules will provide increased clarity and life safety measures for
building construction in Washington state.

ATTACHMENT A: SUMMARY OF PROPOSED CHANGES
2021 IBC Amendments to Chapter 51-50 WAC

WAC Section Changes in 2021 Rationale/Discussion
WAC 51-50-003 003 Change 2018 to 2021. Editorial change
WAC 51-50-005 005 Change reference from 2009 A117.1 to ICC A117.1-2017 is the most current version.
2017.
WAC 51-50-007 007 Change 2015 to 2021. 2021 IEBC is the most current code.
WAC 51-50-008 008 Replaces February 1, 2021, with July 1, July 1, 2023, is the effective date for all 2021 codes.
2023.
WAC 51-50-009 009 Remove existing language and reserve The existing language is relocated in Chapters 2 and 4 (Section
WAC 51-50-009. 430); there is no change in regulatory effect.
WAC 51-50-0110 110.3.5 Remove the state amendment and reserve The existing amendment is no longer needed; it is addressed in
through WAC 51-50-0110. the model code.
110.3.12.1

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 1 1] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-0202 Definitions AUTOMATIC LOAD MANAGEMENT The term is used in the new proposal in Section 429.
SYSTEM (ALMS). New definition.
COMPOST. The existing language is relocated in Chapters 2 and 4 (Section
Relocated from WAC 51-50-009. 430); there is no change in regulatory effect.
ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CAPABLE The term is used in the new proposal in Section 429.
PARKING SPACE. New definition.
ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CHARGER. The term is used in the new proposal in Section 429.
ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) READY The term is used in the new proposal in Section 429.
PARKING SPACE. New definition.
ELECTRIC VEHICLE SUPPLY The term is used in the new proposal in Section 429.
EQUIPMENT (EVSE). New definition.
HIGH-RISE BUILDING. Corrects a previous ambiguity by adding an occupied roof with
New definition. an occupant load of 50 or more.
LOFT. The term is used in the new proposal in
New definition. Sections 420.14, 505.1,907.2.11.1,907.2.11.2, 1011.15,

1011.16, 1015.2, 1015.3.

MASS TIMBER. Remove existing Addressed in the model code.
definition.
NIGHTCLUB. Modifying the existing The A-2 occupancy is addressed in the 2021 IBC (as well as in
definition. The reference to 2006 IBC all other codes after 2006); there is no need for a reference to
regarding Group A-2 is proposed for an old code to be maintained.
remove [removal].
NONCOMBUSTABLE PROTECTION The existing definition is no longer needed; it is addressed in
(For MASS TIMBER). Remove existing the model code.
definition.
RECYCLED MATERIALS. The existing language is relocated in Chapters 2 and 4 (Section
Relocated from WAC 51-50-009. 430); there is no change in regulatory effect.
WALL, LOAD BEARING. The existing definition is no longer needed; it is addressed in
Remove existing definition. the model code.

WAC 51-50-0306 306.2 Add: Energy storage systems (ESS) in Incorporates changes in the model code.
dedicated use buildings.
Add: Water/sewer treatment facilities.

WAC 51-50-0308 308.1.1 Remove defined terms. Intended to match the model code format.

308.2 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates changes in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0309 309.1 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates changes in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0310 310.3 Reformat existing language. Intended to match the format in the model code. There is no
intended change in regulatory effect.

WAC 51-50-0403 403.3.2 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.

403.5.4 Referenced sections renumbering. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.

WAC 51-50-0405 405.7.2 * New WAC number for existing WAC number and section title were previously omitted. The
amendment. proposal also incorporates renumbering in the model code.
* Referenced section renumbering.
WAC 51-50-0407 407.4.4.3 Remove the state amendment and save The existing amendment (deletes the exception allowing 125
WAC 51-50-0407 as reserved. feet travel distance) was intended to avoid conflicts with the
federal requirements. The model code is modified to reflect
recent changes in the federal rules; there is no longer need for
the existing amendment.
WAC 51-50-0412 412.7.3 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates changes in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0420 420 * Sections 420.11, 420.11.1, 420.11.2, Modifications are intended to incorporate section renumbering
420.11.3,420.11.4,420.11.5, 420.11.6, and | in the model code.
420.12 are renumbered.
* Section references in Section 420.14 (as
renumbered), Item 9, are renumbered.

420.14 Add new Section 420.14 (Lofts) with Introduces "lofts" into the IBC as WA amendment. The concept
subsequent subsections (420.14.1, is taken from Section R327 of the IRC, as amended. Lofts have
420.14.2,420.14.3,420.14.4, 420.14.4.1, been used in jurisdictions for years to put "extra" space to use.
420.14.5). However, there is nothing in the code that regulates them. This

proposal is intended to provide a reasonable balance between
flexibility and safety for lofts.
WAC 51-50-0429 429 Replace the existing requirements for EV Statutory mandate pursuant to HB 1287.
infrastructure with a new proposal.
New 430 Relocation. The existing language in WAC 51-50-009 is relocated in

WAC 51-50-0430

Chapters 2 and 4; no change in regulatory effect.

Certified on 1/13/2022

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-0503 503.1.4 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
503.1.4.1 New section addressing enclosures of The current limit on the guard height was based on fire
occupied roof areas. The new amendment department access to the roof. Once the roof deck is higher than
adds Exception 2 - addressing the high-rise | fire ladder access, there is no longer justification for this
buildings. limitation. There have been concerns that higher guards are
needed on higher roofs to prevent people from jumping off the
roof and/or to allow for wind breaks to limit items blowing off
the roof deck and falling on people below. This proposal
addresses both concerns.
503.1.4.2 New section. See Section 1015.2.
WAC 51-50-0504 504.4.1 Referenced section renumbering. Incorporates changes in the model code (renumbering).
WAC 51-50-0505 505.1 New section. Adds "lofts" as an exception reference section for correlation.
See rationale for Section 420.14.
WAC 51-50-0506 Table 506.2 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is no longer needed; it is addressed in
WAC 51-50-0506. the model code.
WAC 51-50-0508 508.4.4.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
508.5.1 New section. Delete Item 4 from the model | Removes an unenforceable limitation. Once the building permit
code language. is issued, the code official does not have the ability to restrict
the number of people in a private residential dwelling unit.
WAC 51-50-0509 509.4.1.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0510 510.2 * Incorporates changes in the model code. Eliminates the Group A 299 occupant load limitation in its
* Corrects errors in the existing amendment | entirety and let the overall provisions found in the IBC dictate
(Exception 4 is Item 4 in the model code). the design of Group A buildings or buildings with Group A
* Amends Items 5 and 7. occupancy constructed over horizontal assembly.
510.5 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0601 Table 601 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is no longer needed; it is addressed in
WAC 51-50-0601. the model code.
WAC 51-50-0602 Table 602 Remove existing amendments in Table 602 | The existing amendments are no longer needed; all are
602.4 and Sections 602.4, 602.4.1, 602.4.1.1, addressed in the model code.
602.4.1.2,602.4.1.2.1, 602.4.1.3,
602.4.1.4,602.4.1.5, 602.4.1.6, 602.4.2,
602.4.2.1,602.4.2.2,602.4.2.2.1,
602.4.2.2.3,602.4.2.2.4, 602.4.2.5,
602.4.2.6, 602.4.3, 602.4.3.1, 602.4.3.2,
602.4.3.3,602.4.3.4, 602.4.3.5, 602.4.3.6,
602.4.4, 602.4.4.1, and 602.4.4.2.
602.4.2.2.2 Modify existing amendments. The The RISE fire tests demonstrate that the proposed
6024204 proposed increase of allowable unprotected | amounts of unprotected areas on the ceiling and walls, as a
it area on the ceiling from 20 percent to 100 function of floor area, can be safely implemented while still
percent is consistent with the recently achieving the performance objectives specified by the ICC Tall
completed research conducted at the Wood Building Ad-Hoc Committee in the development of the
Research Institute of Sweden (RISE). tall building mass timber provisions in the 2021 I-codes. (See
proposal # 21-GP1-87 for detailed rationale.)
602.4.2.3 Modify existing amendment. Intended to address a conflict. For Type IV-B construction, the
current code requires the underside of mass timber floor
assemblies to be protected in accordance with the provisions
for Type IV-A construction (the last sentence in Section
602.4.2.3 points to Section 602.4.1.2). However, Section
602.4.1.2 does not permit exposed mass timber. This conflicts
with Section 602.4.2.2.2, which allows some limited exposed
mass timber. This proposal eliminates the conflict by clarifying
the reference to Type IV-A construction does not apply to the
unprotected portions of mass timber permitted for Type IV-B
construction.
602.4.4.3 New section; the amendment is in Item 3. Adequately conveys the intent of the third protection
alternative. Only combustible surfaces in concealed spaces
need to be protected. If a concealed space is created by furring
out with steel studs, for instance, only the heavy timber
surfaces would need to be sheathed with 5/8-inch Type X
gypsum board, not the steel studs.
WAC 51-50-0603 603.1 Remove existing amendment and reserve Technical advisory group (TAG) recommended remove
WAC 51-50-0603. [removal] of the existing amendment; the reference to Section
2304.10.5 is unnecessary.
WAC 51-50-0703 703.8 Remove existing amendments and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
703.9 WAC 51-50-0703. model code.
WAC 51-50-0704 704.6.1 Replace the existing amendment with a Intended to clarify the application of the new code section that

new amendment. The proposed
amendment modifies the new model code
language in Section 704.6.1.

was approved for 2021 IBC. As currently written, secondary
steel attachment is not a defined term in the code and may be
confused with the definition of secondary structural members
in IBC Chapter 2. The proposed language is consistent with
FS11-21 (attached to the proposal), which was approved by the
ICC Fire Safety Committee for inclusion in the 2024 IBC.

Certified on 1/13/2022

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-0705 705 Modify the title by deleting "and Title is corrected to align with the model code.
projections."
705.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
705.2.4 Renumbered to 705.2.5. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.
705.2.5 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0706 706.3 New section. Type III and IV buildings are required to have fire walls made
7064 N " of approved non-combustible materials. Limiting the make-up
: ew section. of fire walls to non-combustible materials can result in
Table 706.4 New table. problems for taller III and IV buildings. Material shrinkage and
differential vertical shrinkage between dissimilar non-
combustible fire wall materials and the combustible building
bearing wall, may cause long term damage to the fire wall.
Testing supporting the mass timber provisions recently
approved for IBC suggest a different approach to these fire
walls.
706.6.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0707 707.4 Remove existing amendments and reserve The model code addresses all existing amendments.
707.5 WAC 51-50-0707.
WAC 51-50-0713 713.13.4 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
WAC 51-50-0717 717 Remove existing amendments and reserve The model code addresses all existing amendments.
717.5.2 WAC 51-50-0717.
717.5.4

WAC 51-50-0718 718.2.1 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-0718. model code.

WAC 51-50-0722 722.7 Remove existing amendments. The model code addresses all existing amendments.

722.7.1
Tables
722.7.1(1)
722.7.1(2)
722.7.2
722.7.2.1

WAC 51-50-0803 803.3 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-0803. model code.

WAC 51-50-0902 Delete Section 902. Editorial modification to match WAC format.

WAC 51-50-0903 903.2.1.3 New section. Adds an exception to the Intended to correlate the IBC/International fire code (IFC)
model code pertaining to fixed guideway requirements for fire protection to NFPA 130 requirements.
transit and passenger rail system stations. The primary purpose is to clarify the requirements for fire

protection at open stations. (See proposal 21-GP1-67 for
detailed rationale.)

903.2.1.6 New section. This is an existing amendment, currently in IFC. The
amendment is proposed for inclusion into IBC for consistency
with IFC.

903.2.3 Renumbering of referenced section. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.

903.2.6.1 Renumbering of referenced section. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.

903.2.7 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.

903.2.9.3 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.

903.2.11.1.3 | New section. This is an existing amendment, currently in the IFC. The
amendment is proposed for inclusion into the IBC for
consistency with the IFC.

903.3.1.2 New section. Undoes a change that was made to the 2021 IFC and IBC
(FS117-18), returning the language in the section to the 2018
text, and aligns the code with the scoping provisions of NFPA
13R. The 2021 change limits the applicability of NFPA 13R
systems for podium buildings, triggering a requirement for a
full NFPA 13 system in more buildings. If adopted by SBCC,
the 2021 IFC/IBC requirement would decrease affordability for
residential construction, since a full NFPA 13 system would be
required in shorter buildings.

WAC 51-50-0907 907.2.3 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates changes in the model code.

907.2.11.1 New sections. Modify the model code by See Rationale for Section 420.14.
907.2.11.2 adding a reference to Section 420.14.
907.5.2.1.2 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates changes in the model code.

WAC 51-50-0908 Delete Section 908. Editorial modification to match WAC format.

WAC 51-50-0911 911.1.2 New section. Incorporates more restrictive This is an existing amendment in the IFC, which is proposed as
requirement for the fire command center an amendment in the IBC. The proposal provides consistency
separation (two-hour instead of one-hour between IFC and IBC.
separation).

WAC 51-50-0913 913.2.1 Renumbering of referenced section. Incorporates renumbering in NFPA 20.

Certified on 1/13/2022

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-0915 915.1 Remove existing amendments in Sections The model code addresses all existing amendments.
915.2 915.1,915.1.2,915.1.3,915.1.4, 915.1.5,
915.1.6,915.2,915.2.1,915.2.2.

WAC 51-50-0918 918.1 New WAC section. The modification to the | Intended to align the terminology being used by industry. This
model code revises the terms used in this is also proposed code change F32-21 in Group A proposed
section. changes to the 2024 IFC and 2024 IBC. It was approved as

submitted by the committee.

WAC 51-50-1003 1003.7 New WAC section. Adds Exception 2 to See rationale for Section 3116.
the model code and refers to Section 3116
for escalators used as a means of egress for
fixed transit and passenger rail systems.

Table Add fixed guideway transit and passenger See rationale for Section 3116.
1004.5 rail systems; platform, and concourse/
lobby.

WAC 51-50-1005 1005.1 New section adds Exception 2 to the model | See rationale for Section 3116.
code; refers to Section 3116 for escalators
used as means of egress for fixed transit/
passenger rail systems.

WAC 51-50-1006 1006.2.1 Modify existing amendment. Adds See rationale for Section 3116.

Exception 4 to the model code and refers
to Section 3116 for common path of travel
for fixed transit and passenger rail system
stations.
1006.2.1.1 New section. Adds an exception to the See rationale for Section 3116.
model code addressing the number of
required exits for fixed transit and
passenger rail systems.
1006.2.2.4 Remove existing amendment. This section is no longer in the model code; there is no need for
this amendment.
1006.2.2.7 Remove existing amendment. The existing amendment and the new model code section
1006.2.2.4 have the same regulatory effect. New Section
1006.2.2.4 refers to NFPA 70, Articles 110.26 and 110.33 for
electrical equipment rated 1,000 volts or less, and more than
1,000 volts. The existing amendment in 1006.2.2.7 provides the
same requirements, but it is more specific, using language from
NFPA 70, Articles 110.26 and 110.33.
1006.3.3 Renumbered to 1006.3.4; renumbering of Incorporates renumbering in the model code.
referenced sections.
Tables Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
1006.3.3(1)
1006.3.3(2)
WAC 51-50-1009 1009.1 Renumber referenced section. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.
1009.2.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
1009.8.1 Modify existing amendment. Modified to incorporate the model code new language.
WAC 51-50-10100 1010.1.9.4 Delete existing amendment. Relocated to Section 1010.2.4 to align with the model code
renumbering. (See rationale for Section 1010.2.4.)
1010.1.9.7 Delete existing amendment. Relocated to Section 1010.2.14 to align with the model code
renumbering. (See rationale for 1010.2.14.)
1010.1.10 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code Section 1010.2.9.
1010.1.10.3 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the new model code section 1010.2.9.2.
1010.2.4 Relocate existing amendment, as modified. | The existing amendment is formally removed. The model code
The existing amendment is currently in is adopted without Item 2; Item 2 is replaced with the existing
Section 1010.1.9.4. amendment currently in Section 1010.1.9.4, Item 7. The
existing amendment in Section 1010.1.9.4, Item 8, is not
needed because it is addressed by the model code.
1010.2.14 Relocate existing amendment, as modified. The existing amendment is formally removed. The model code
The existing amendment is currently in is adopted as amended, with the existing amendments in Item 6
Section 1010.1.9.7. and Exception 1. The existing amendments in the first
paragraph and Items 1, 2, and 4 are no longer needed;
addressed by the model code.
1010.3.4.1 Adds a new section to the model code See rationale for Section 3116.
addressing fixed transit and passenger rail
systems.
WAC 51-50-1011 1011.7 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
1011.1 New section. The amendment adds an See rationale for Section 420.14.
exception to the model code addressing
lofts.
1011.17 Remove existing amendment. Existing amendment is replaced with Section 1011.1. (See
Rationale for Section 420.14.)
WAC 51-50-1012 1012.1 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates model code changes.

Certified on 1/13/2022

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-1014 1014.2 New section in WAC; new section in the The code does not currently regulate the lateral distance that a
model code. handrail can be located away from the edge of the walking
. - - surface of a stair, ramp or aisle. If a designer wanted to locate a
1014.2.1 11\1571‘2 Szeftl(l)g 112 ;V‘IAC’ renumbers Section handrail 24 inches away from the walking surface, there is
<t i currently no code provision to prevent that. Most building
1014.2.2 New section in WAC; new section in the officials would not permit that design, but there is no code to
model code. support them. The data provided as part of this proposal helps
— - - justifications for limiting the lateral distance of the handrail to
1014.8 New section in WAC; modifies the model be not more than six inches from the edge of the walking
code. surface. This code change is needed to ensure handrails will be
located close enough to the edge of the walking surface to
provide adequate support for pedestrians with limited reach
capabilities.
1014.3 New section in WAC; new section in The same as 1014.2.2; research.
model code.
WAC 51-50-1015 1015.2 New section. The new amendment requires | There are many cases where the design of an occupied roof
guards to be provided at the perimeter of includes only a portion of the entire roof area. Occupied
the occupied portions of an occupied roof, portions of roofs are typically elevated 18 inches or less above
and provides two Exceptions (Exception 9 the adjacent unoccupied areas of the roof; therefore, no guard is
and exception 10). In addition, the new currently required for these areas. This issue is regularly
amendment provides a reference to Section | debated due to the lack of regulatory authority to require the
420.14 pertaining to lofts. guard in this design scenario. This proposal will eliminate or
drastically reduce the potential for kids or adults who may be
inebriated, from falling over the edge of a roof even if the
occupied portion of the roof is some distance away from the
roof edge. (See also Rationale for Section 420.14.)
1015.3 New section. Adds Exception 4 to the See Rationale for Section 420.1.4.
model code pertaining to lofts.
WAC 51-50-10170 Table New amendment adds Section 3116 to See rationale for Section 3116.
1017.2 footnote (a).
WAC 51-50-1019 1019.3 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates new model code language.
WAC 51-50-1020 1020.4 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.
1020.5 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates new model code language.
WAC 51-50-1023 1023.2 Remove existing amendment. The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
1023.5 model code.
1023.12 Section 21023.11 is renumbered to Incorporates changes in the model code.
1023.12.
WAC 51-50-1024 1024.9 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-1024. model code.
WAC 51-50-1030 1030.6 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-1030. model code.
WAC 51-50-1101 1101.2.1 Remove existing amendment. The requirement for clear width of accessible routes in 2009
American National Standards Institute (ANSI) A117.1 and
2010 ADA Standards is 36 inches. The existing WA
amendment requires 44 inches, and it is [a] more stringent
requirement for exterior routes of travel. In 2017 ANSI, the
language in Section 403.5 is modified; the requirements are 36
inches for interior accessible routes and 48 inches for exterior
accessible route. IBC TAG recommended remove [removal] of
the existing amendment.
1101.2.2 Modify existing amendment. The modifications incorporate changes in 2017 ANSI. In
addition, the existing exception is proposed for remove
[removal]. ANSI Section 404.2 is titled "Manual doors,
doorways and manual gates" and does not address automatic
doors. There is no need for the existing exception because
Section 404.3 is specific to automatic doors.
1101.2.3 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in 2017 ANSL
1101.2.4 Modify referenced section from 606.7 to Keep the existing amendment as modified to provide the
603.6. correct reference.
WAC 51-50-1105 1105.1.8 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
Table WAC 51-50-1105. model code.
1105.1.8
WAC 51-50-1106 1106.7 Renumber Section 1106.6 to 1106.7. Incorporates renumbering in the model code.

Certified on 1/13/2022

WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-1107 1107 Add new Section 1107 Motor-vehicle Incorporates new model code section.
related facilities. The existing Section 1107
Dwelling units and sleeping units is
renumbered to 1108; Sections 1107.5,
1107.5.1, 1107.5.1.1, 1107.5.1.2,
1107.5.1.3,1107.5.2, 1107.5.2.1, 1107.5.4,
1107.6.2.2.1, 1107.6.2.3 are removed.

1107.2 New section. Modifies the model code The exception conflicts with an existing amendment in IBC
exception by deleting R-2 and R-4 Section 429.5, which requires at least one accessible parking
occupancy groups. space to be served by EV charging infrastructure if the

infrastructure is required (including for R-2 occupancies). R-4
occupancy group is deleted because it is not adopted in
Washington.

1107.2.1 Add a reference to IBC Section 429.4. Provisions for EV charging are located in Section 429; Section
429.4 addresses accessible EV charging spaces.

1107.5 Remove existing amendments in Sections The existing amendments are not needed; they are addressed in
1107.5, 1107.5.1, 1107.5.1.1, 1107.5.1.2, the model code.
1107.5.1.3,1107.5.2, 1107.5.2.1, 1107.5.4.

1107.6.2.2.1 | Relocated/renumbered to 1108.6.2.2.1.

1107.6.2.3 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.

WAC 51-50-1108 1108 New WAC section with existing title. WAC renumbering to align with renumbering in the model
Dwelling units and sleeping units are code.
currently in Section 1107.

1108.6.2.2.1 | Renumber existing amendment currently in | The renumbering is necessary due to renumbering in the model
Section 1107.6.2.2.1; renumber a section code.
reference in the text.

WAC 51-50-1109 1109.2 Remove existing amendments and reserve Section 1109.2 is renumbered to 1110.2 to align with model
WAC 51-50-1109 code renumbering.
(1109.2.4,1109.2.4.1, 1109.2.4.2,
1109.4.2.2.1 [1109.2.4.2.1], 1109.2.4.2.2,
1109.2.4.2.3,1109.2.4.3, 1109.2.4.4,
1109.2.4.5,1109.2.4.6, 1109.2.5,
1109.2.5.1, 1109.2.5.2, 1109.2.5.3,
1109.2.5.3.1, 1109.2.5.3.2, 1109.2.5.4,
1109.2.5.5,1109.2.5.6, 1109.2.5.7,
1109.2.5.8, 1109.2.5.9).
1109.5.1 Section 1109.5.1 is renumbered to 1110.5.1 to align with model
code renumbering.
WAC 51-50-1110 1110.2 New WAC section with existing title. The renumbering is necessary due to renumbering in the model

1110.5.1 "Other features and facilities" is currently code.
in WAC 51-50-1109. Sections 1110.2 and The current amendment and the proposed modification will
1110.5.1 are renumbered (currently 1109.2 ensure that the number of accessible toilet or bathing fixtures is
and 1109.5.1). not reduced when the required toilet and bathing facilities are
Modify the existing amendment in Item 3. designed and constructed as gender-neutral.

WAC 51-50-1202 1202.2 Section 1202.2 Attic spaces is renumbered Incorporates changes in the model code.

1202.2.1 to 1202.2.1 and retitled to Ventilated attics
and rafter spaces.

1202.7.1 Renumber section references. Editorial corrections due to errors.

1202.7.1.1

1202.7.1.2

1202.7.2.2

1202.7.2.3

1202.7.3.1

WAC 51-50-1204 1204.1 Remove existing amendments and reserve The existing amendments are not needed; duplicate existing
WAC 51-50-1204. amendments in Section 1203.

1204.2.1

1204.2.2

1204.2.3

WAC 51-50-1206 1206.1 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-1206. model code.
WAC 51-50-1207 1207.4 Remove existing amendment and reserve The existing amendment is not needed; it is addressed in the
WAC 51-50-1207. model code.
WAC 51-50-1208 1208.3 New section; adds requirements for The code, as currently written, can be interpreted to allow a
dwelling unit size. one-bedroom unit to be smaller than an efficiency dwelling
P - - unit. This change makes it clear that a dwelling unit and

1208.4 New section; modifies the requirements for efficiency dwelling unit are subject to the same size
foom area. limitations. It also clarifies that sleeping units are subject to the

1208.5 New section; modifies the requirements for | same minimum size requirements as habitable rooms in

efficiency dwelling units.

dwelling units.

Certified on

1/13/2022 [ 7]

WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-1209 1209.3.1 Remove existing amendments and reserve The existing amendments are relocated to
WAC 51-50-1209. WAC 51-50-1210.
1209.3.2
1210.3.1 Relocated from WAC 51-50-1209.
1210.3.2
WAC 51-50-1402 1402.2 New WAC with new section. Relocated from WAC 51-50-1403.
WAC 51-50-1403 1403.2 Remove existing amendments and reserve Relocated to WAC 51-50-1402.
WAC 51-50-1403.

WAC 51-50-1405 Delete Section 1405. Editorial to match the WAC format.

WAC 51-50-2900 Delete "Chapter 29 Plumbing systems" and | Editorial; assign WAC numbers to all sections instead of one
reserve WAC 51-50-2900. WAC number for Chapter 29.

WAC 51-50-2901 New WAC number.

2901.1 Modify the existing amendment. The existing amendment was adopted in 2012 and it was
consistent with the model code at that time. The model code
was modified in 2015 and 2018, but the state amendment was
never modified. This modification is for consistency with the
new model code.

2901.3 Renumber section reference. Incorporates renumbering in the model code Chapter 31.

WAC 51-50-2902 New WAC number.

2902.1.4 Remove existing amendment. No longer needed; the model code addresses (and expands) the
state language in Section 2902.1.2.

2902.2 Modify existing amendment. The existing amendment is modified to align with the model
code language. Exception 4 was added in 2018 IBC but was
never added to the existing state amendment. This modification
corrects this oversight. Exception 7, as shown, is new in 2021
IBC and is added to the existing amendment.

2902.2.1 Remove existing amendment. Addressed in the model code.

2902.3 Modify existing amendment. The first paragraph is language from 2015 IBC; it was never
updated to align with the 2018 IBC. The modification corrects
this oversight. Exception 1 is also modified for consistency
with the model code.

2902.3.3 Modify existing amendment. Exception 1 is an existing amendment that matches the new
Exception 2. The modification incorporates the model code
language.

2902.6 New section; the text clarifies Section To eliminate confusion between Washington State Amendment

2902.6 addressing small appliances is not 2902.5.1 and IBC Section 2902.6. IBC Section 2902.6 requires

adopted. drinking fountains for occupant loads greater than 15. It relies
on IBC Table 2902.1 for the scoping of the number of required
drinking fountains.

2902.7 Renumber to 2902.8. Incorporates section renumbering in the model code.

2902.8 Renumber to 2902.9.

WAC 51-50-3004 Delete Section 3004. Editorial to match the WAC format.

WAC 51-50-3101 3101.1 Modify existing amendment. Align with the model code formatting.

WAC 51-50-3102 3102.3 Remove existing amendments and reserve Existing amendments are addressed in the model code.

3102.6.1.1 WAC 51-50-3102.

WAC 51-50-3103 3103.1 Modify existing amendment. Incorporates language from the model code (adds the phrase
"special event and umbrella structures"). For clarity, the
existing amendment is shown with strikeout and the modified
version is underlined.

WAC 51-50-3114 3114 Remove existing amendments and reserve Section 3114 is relocated to WAC 51-50-3116 (new WAC

3114.1 WAC 51-50-3114. number); Section 3114.1 is proposed for remove [removal].

WAC 51-50-3116 3116 Section 3116 is relocated from WAC Renumbering is necessary because new sections were added to

3116.1 51-50-3114; the code language currently in | the model code. NFPA 130 is modified to align with the most

3116.2 3114 is given a section number (3116.1) current version. The new proposal in Section 3116.2 is drawn

and a title (Construction). New Section from NFPA 130 amendments by the City of Bellevue and the

3116.2 is proposed to summarize City of Seattle for means of egress for light rail stations. The

modifications to NFPA 130. The existing intent is to provide clarity for more consistent application of the

Section 3114.1 is removed. IBC and NFPA 130 in the future as light rail service expands
and extends into new jurisdictions. Confusion on how the codes
correlate can result in schedule delay and additional work for
the agency and the authority having jurisdiction. (See proposal
# 21-GP1-66 for rationale.)

WAC 51-50-3304 3304.2 Remove existing amendments and reserve Relocated to WAC 51-50-3314. (New WAC number.)

WAC 51-50-3304.

WAC 51-50-3314 3314 New WAC number; Section 3304 Site Reorganization and retitling is necessary due to the model code

3314.1 work is renumbered to 3314 and retitled to changes.

"Fire watch during construction."

WAC 51-50-3401

Delete Section 3401.

Editorial to match WAC format.

WAC 51-50-3404

Delete Section 3404.

Editorial to match WAC format.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 8 ]

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

WAC 51-50-3410 Delete Section 3410. Editorial to match WAC format.
WAC 51-50-3411 Delete Section 3411. Editorial to match WAC format.
WAC 51-50-3500 Chapter 35 Delete ANSI/APA PRG-320-18. No longer needed; addressed in the model code.
Change NFPA 130-17 to NFPA 130-20. Updated to the most current standard.
WAC 51-50-4700 Appendix D | Remove existing amendments, use The existing amendment is no longer needed; it is addressed in

WAC 51-50-4700 for proposed Appendix the model code.
P.

WAC 51-50-4700 Appendix P New appendix addressing construction and | The optional appendix is intended to reduce the amount of
demolition material management. The construction and demolition waste that goes to a landfill after
appendix will be effective only if adopted leaving a construction site. For jurisdictions where material
by a local ordinance. management is a priority, this language helps to increase the

amount of material that is salvaged for reuse or recycled
[recycling]. In partnership with this proposed appendix are two
forms, a Salvage Assessment and Waste Diversion Report. (See
proposal # 21-GP1-116 for detailed rationale.)

Note: Those not listed on the table above remain as adopted in 2018 IBC.

Reasons Supporting Proposal: RCW 19.27.031, 19.27.074, and
19.27.540.

Statutory Authority for Adoption: RCW 19.27.031, 19.27.074, and
19.27.540.

Statute Being Implemented: RCW 19.27.031, 19.27.074, and
19.27.540.

Rule is not necessitated by federal law, federal or state court
decision.

Name of Proponent: SBCC, governmental.

Name of Agency Personnel Responsible for Drafting and Implementa-
tion: Stoyan Bumbalov, 1500 Jefferson Street S.E., Olympia, WA 98504,
360-407-9277; and Enforcement: Local jurisdictions having authority.

A school district fiscal impact statement is not required under
RCW 28A.305.135.

A cost-benefit analysis is required under RCW 34.05.328. A pre-
liminary cost-benefit analysis may be obtained by contacting Stoyan
Bumbalov, 1500 Jefferson Street S.E., Olympia, WA 98504, phone
360-407-9277, email sbcc@des.wa.gov.

This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt from
requirements of the Regulatory Fairness Act because the proposal:

Is exempt under RCW 19.85.025(3) as the rules are adopting or in-
corporating by reference without material change federal
statutes or regulations, Washington state statutes, rules of
other Washington state agencies, shoreline master programs
other than those programs governing shorelines of statewide
significance, or, as referenced by Washington state law, na-
tional consensus codes that generally establish industry
standards, if the material adopted or incorporated regulates
the same subject matter and conduct as the adopting or in-
corporating rule; and rule content is explicitly and specif-
ically dictated by statute.

The proposed rule does impose more-than-minor costs on business-
es. There are costs imposed by the proposed rule, but the costs do not
fall disproportionately on small businesses. The rule will not affect
the distribution of impacted work, whether by small businesses or not,
doing the work. The rule does not affect employment, reporting or re-
cord keeping.

Small Business Economic Impact Statement

Description: SBCC is filing a proposed rule to adopt the 2021 ed-
ition of the International Building Code (IBC), nonstructural provi-
sions (chapter 51-50 WAC). Since 1985, SBCC has been responsible to
update to new editions of the building code per RCW 19.27.074. IBC is

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 9 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

updated every three years by the ICC. The code development process
conducted by the model code organization is open to all interest
groups within the design and construction industry and from governmen-
tal organizations. See www.iccsafe.org for more information about the
model code development process.

The administrative compliance requirements are under the authori-
ty of the local governments (RCW 19.27.050). Enforcement activities,
including permit issuance, plan review/approval, and inspections occur
at the local level. Requirements for construction documents submittal
and other reporting mandates are determined by the local jurisdiction
and are consistent with previously established policies. The proposed
amendments to chapter 51-50 WAC include specific technical require-
ments for building construction to be consistent with national stand-
ards.

Professional Services: Washington has had a statewide building
code in effect since 1974. The local enforcement authority having ju-
risdiction administers the codes through the building and/or fire de-
partments. Administrative procedures for state building code compli-
ance are established and will not be changed by the adoption of the
2021 building codes. Small businesses will employ the same types of
professional services for the design and construction of buildings and
systems to comply with the state building code. The proposed rule up-
dates the state building code and does not require additional equip-
ment, supplies, labor, or other services. Services needed to comply
with the building code are existing within the construction industry
as required by the local authority having jurisdiction.

Exemptions: There are 26 significant changes to the model code
with economic impact. However, the model code changes are exempt under
RCW 19.85.025(3) and 34.05.310 (4) (c), and are not part of this re-
port.

Section 429 related to electric vehicle charging infrastructure
is a statutory mandate pursuant to HB 1287 (2021). This section is ex-
empt under RCW 19.85.025(3) and 34.05.310 (4) (e), and is not part of
this report.

Costs of Compliance for Businesses: SBCC is required to adopt and
maintain the state building code, as provided in chapters 19.27,
19.27A, and 70.92 RCW, and the state legislature. The primary objec-
tive of SBCC is to encourage consistency in the building code through-
out the state of Washington and to maintain the building code consis-
tent with the state's interest as provided in RCW 19.27.020. An objec-
tive of statewide adoption is to minimize state amendments to the mod-
el codes. SBCC accepts statewide code amendment proposal from stake-
holders to amend IBC to meet the legislative goals. The statewide code
adoption process is defined in chapter 51-04 WAC and SBCC bylaws. All
proposals must be submitted in writing on the appropriate form with
the indicated supporting documentation. Each proponent must identify
where a proposed amendment has an economic impact, and estimate the
costs and savings of the proposal on construction practices, users
and/or the public, the enforcement community, and operation and main-
tenance.

The cost of compliance incurred by Washington businesses includes
training and educational materials. The new 2021 IBC, 2021 IBC Signif-
icant changes and 2021 IBC Study pack cost $215 + tax, shipping, and
handling. 2021 IBC is also available online at https://
shop.iccsafe.org.

For the 2021 code adoption cycle, SBCC received 33 proposals. IBC
TAG recommended approval of 28 proposals as submitted or as modified.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 10 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Nine proposals were identified by TAG as having a cost (increase or
decrease) for compliance on businesses. SBCC recommended filing the
proposed rule to allow input through the public hearing process.

1. Section 903.3.1.2 (21-GP1-021): Undoes a change that was made
to the 2021 IFC and IBC (FS117-18), returning the language in the sec-
tion to the 2018 text, and aligns the code with the scoping provisions
of NFPA 13R. The 2021 change unnecessarily limits the applicability of
NEFPA 13R systems, particularly for podium buildings, triggering a re-
gquirement for a full NFPA 13 system in more buildings. If adopted by
SBCC, the 2021 IFC/IBC requirement would decrease affordability for
residential construction, since a full NFPA 13 system would be re-
quired in shorter buildings. The new proposal will decrease construc-
tion cost.

According to a November 2020 article on the National Fire Sprin-
kler Association website:

e The National Multifamily Housing Council members estimate a
NFPA 13 system costs "an average of $1 to $2 more per square foot than
NEFPA 13R."

e "NFPA Journal notes that installing an NFPA 13 system can cost
four to six times more than an NFPA 13R system and include a four to
six times greater construction turnaround time."

2. Section 202, new definition for high-rise building (21-
GP1-036) : This change will address a lack of clarity in the code where
it is difficult to determine if an occupied roof is considered a
floor. Adding an occupied roof with an occupant load of 50 or more to
the definition removes ambiguity. This definition will place some
buildings into the high-rise category, which will require additional
life-safety systems to be installed that otherwise would not have been
required. The proponent establishes that additional costs for these
systems could be anywhere between $100,000 to $1,000,000 per project,
depending on the size of the project.

Nevertheless, SBCC staff research determined that this cost will
not be applicable to all projects. Determining what qualifies as a
high-rise building is a fairly unigque measurement of height that is
not based on the definition of "building height." The critical meas-
urement is from the lowest ground location where a fire department
will be able to set its firefighting equipment to a floor level of oc-
cupied floors. The term "occupied floor" is not defined in IBC, and as
it is stated in this proposal, the requirements for high-rise build-
ings are enforced differently throughout the state. Some jurisdictions
are considering an occupied roof equivalent to an occupied floor; oth-
ers do not include it into the height measurement. Therefore, SBCC
staff considers this proposal clarifies the application of the code,
and is needed for consistency with enforcement. There is no statewide
direct cost associated with its adoption.

3. Sections IBC 903.2.1.3, Chapter 10 (various sections) and 3116
(21-GP1-66; 21-GP1-67): The code proposals are addressing fixed guide-
way and passenger rail systems. Proposal #21-GP1-67 is intended to
correlate IBC/IFC requirements for fire protection to NFPA 130 re-
quirements. The primary purpose is to clarify the requirements for
fire protection at open stations. IBC Chapter 9 requires fire protec-
tion in Group A3 occupancies and levels from the Group A3 occupancy to
the level of exit discharge. However, for open stations, NFPA 130 only
requires fire protection in areas with combustible loading. The code
and standard are in conflict, but pursuant to Chapter 1 of IBC, the
code language prevails. Some jurisdictions have required fire protec-
tion at the platform level and at the plaza level while others have

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 11 1] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

not. This code clarification would bring consistency across all juris-
dictions and will result in significant decrease in building cost. For
justification, the proponent uses an estimate for elevated station in
design in North Seattle, which shows a significant decrease in build-
ing costs of $225,348. Proposal # 21-GP1-66 is drawn from NFPA 130
amendments by the City of Bellevue and the City of Seattle for means
of egress for light rail stations. The intent is to provide clarity
for more consistent application of IBC and NFPA 130 in the future as
light rail service expands and extends into new jurisdictions. The
proposal clarifies conflicts between IBC and NFPA 130; there is no as-
sociated cost with the adoption.

4. Sections 420.14 (new), 202, 505.1, 907.2.11.1, 907.2.11.2,
1011.14, 1015.2, 1015.3 (21-GP1-74): Introduces "lofts" into IBC as WA
amendment. The concept is taken from Section R327 of IRC, as amended.
Lofts have been proposed and used in several jurisdictions for many
years 1n order to put "extra" space to use. However, there is nothing
in the code that regulates them. This proposal is intended to provide
a reasonable balance between flexibility and safety for these types of
spaces. The proponent determined that there will be an increase in
construction costs including the cost for one extra smoke alarm and
guards for each loft. The additional costs will depend on the size and
number of lofts in the dwelling unit. Smoke alarms cost less than $20
each. Based on the price of deck guard systems, the materials for a
premanufactured loft guard system will cost between $15 and $40 a lin-
ear foot. Installation costs will be in addition to the material
costs. Nevertheless, SBCC staff research determined that there will be
no additional cost for businesses if this proposal is adopted. Provi-
sions for lofts are already adopted in IRC (Section R327) and used, on
occasions, for projects constructed under IBC. Adopting the same or
similar requirements in IBC will provide clarity and consistency for
enforcement. The provisions originate from the IRC Appendix Q (Tiny
Houses), which contains some provisions for "recreational park vehi-
cles" governed by ANSI Al119.5. The adoption of Appendix Q was intended
to reduce the cost and allow construction of tiny homes, not to create
more restrictive (and expensive) requirements. This includes the pro-
visions for lofts, which lessens the incentive to misrepresent an in-
tended use and enables building departments to regulate the health and
safety of loft spaces based on their actual intended use, ensuring
health and safety with minimum loft dimensions, requirements for ac-
cess and egress, and proper emergency escape and rescue openings. SBCC
staff considers this proposal is needed to provide more affordable
housing, to clarify the application of the code, and for consistency
with enforcement. There is no direct cost associated with its adoption
if applied to the cost of construction as a whole, and not to the
lofts only.

5. Section 706.3 and 703.4 (21-GP1-80): Type III and IV buildings
are required to have fire walls made of approved noncombustible mate-
rials. Limiting the makeup of fire walls to noncombustible materials
can result in problems for taller III and IV buildings. According to
the proponent, this change would do away with differential settlement
issues making damage to the noncombustible fire wall due to shrinkage
of the wood bearing walls less of a factor. The costs associated with
this change, as presented by the proponent, would decrease building
costs depending on material prices.

6. Section 510.2 (21-GP1-82): This proposal eliminates the Group
A 299 occupant load limitation to allow overall provisions found in
IBC to dictate the design of the Group A building or building with a

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 12 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Group A occupancy constructed over the horizontal assembly. If accep-
ted, this code change will reduce the cost of construction as build-
ings above a podium building will have a broader choice of types of
construction. The cost will depend on the size/type of projects.

7. Sections 1208.3 (new), 1208.4, 1208.5 (21-GP1-84): Standard-
izes the minimum size requirements for all dwelling units. The code,
as currently written, can be interpreted to allow a one-bedroom unit
to be smaller than an efficiency dwelling unit (EDU). The proposal
makes it clear that a dwelling unit and efficiency dwelling unit are
subject to the same size limitations. It also clarifies that sleeping
units are subject to the same minimum size requirements as habitable
rooms in dwelling units. This proposal, if adopted, would decrease the
cost of developing a one-bedroom unit because it will not be treated
differently from an EDU with respect to size. Since the cost depends
on the type, size, and location of the project, no cost values are
provided by the proponent.

8. Sections 602.4.2.2.2, 602.4.2.2.4 (21-GP1-87): The proposed
increase of allowable unprotected area on the ceiling from 20 percent
to 100 percent is consistent with the recently completed research con-
ducted at RISE. These fire tests demonstrated that the proposed
amounts of unprotected areas on the ceiling and walls, as a function
of floor area, can be safely implemented while still achieving the
performance objectives specified by ICC Tall Wood Building Ad-Hoc Com-—
mittee in the development of the tall building mass timber provisions
in the 2021 I-codes. The proposal, if adopted, would decrease the cost
of construction because it reduces the required amount of noncombusti-
ble protection on walls and ceilings in Type IV-B Construction. Since
the cost depends on the type, size, and location of the project, no
cost values are provided by the proponent.

9. Sections 503.1.4.2, 1015.2 (21-GP1-145): The new amendment re-
quires guards to be provided at the perimeter of the occupied portions
of an occupied roof and provides two exceptions (Exception 9 and Ex-
ception 10). In addition, the new amendment provides a reference to
Section 420.14 pertaining to lofts. Pursuant to the proponent, there
are many cases where the design of an occupied roof includes only a
portion of the entire roof area. The occupied portions of the roof are
typically elevated 18 inches or less above the adjacent unoccupied
areas of the roof; therefore, no guard is currently required for these
areas. This issue is regularly debated due to the lack of regulatory
authority to require the guard in this design scenario. The proposed
code change eliminates or drastically reduces the potential for kids
and adults who may be inebriated, from falling over the edge of a
roof. There will be an increase in cost because more guards will need
to be installed for occupied roofs where only a portion of the roof
area 1s occupied. The proponent estimates the cost to be approximately
$1/SF of the occupied area of the roof.

Loss of Sales or Revenue: The proposed rules make the state code
for building construction consistent with national standards. Busi-
nesses with new products or updated test or design standards are rec-
ognized in the updated building code. The update will result in some
cost outlay for some small businesses for specific building projects,
for a transition period. Other small businesses would see an increase
in revenue. The amendments to the building codes affect over 25,000
small businesses in the state, where construction activity occurs. The
primary intent of the amendments is to improve the safety features in
buildings and provide consistency and fairness across the state, for a

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 13 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

predictable business environment. The amendments should result in en-
hanced safety and value in buildings.

Cost of Compliance for Small Businesses: (Determine whether the
proposed rule will have a disproportionate cost impact on small busi-
nesses, compare the cost of compliance for small business with the
cost of compliance for the 10 percent of businesses that are the larg-
est businesses.) Most businesses affected by the updates to the build-
ing codes are small businesses; over 95 percent of those listed in the
construction and related industries have under 50 employees. The costs
per employee are comparable between the largest businesses and the ma-

jority of small businesses.
is not a disproportionate impact on small businesses.

The cost to comply with the updated codes
Where SBCC found

the cost of compliance for small businesses to be disproportionate,
The proposed rules include a
definition of small business and provide exceptions for compliance
with the updated rule.

the proposed rule mitigates the cost.

Small Businesses Involved in the Development of the Rule:
SBCC conducted 23 open public meetings of the building code tech-
available via telephone conference bridge and

and allowed comment on every item on every agenda.

IBC,

nical advisory group,
over the internet,

For

SBCC appointed over 100 representatives of all segments of the busi-
ness and construction community to serve on the technical advisory

groups.

List of Industries:
comply with the building code:

Below is a list of industries required to

2017 Industry Minor 0.3% of Avg Annual
NAICS Code NAICS Code Title Cost Estimate 1% of Avg Annual Payroll Gross Business Income
236115 | New Single-Family Housing $2,508.04
Construction (except For-Sale $1,919.03 $2,508.04
Builders) 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
236116 | New Multifamily Housing $32,067.43 $17,160.94 $32,067.43
Construction (except For-Sale 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
Builders)
236118 | Residential Remodelers $1,457.74 $1,457.74 $901.20
2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
236210 | Industrial Building Construction $59,169.45 $59,169.45 $53,925.71
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
236220 | Commercial and Institutional $41,552.81 $18,126.81 $41,552.81
Building Construction 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238110 | Poured Concrete Foundation and $3,442.28 $5,027.07 $3,442.28
Structure Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238120 | Structural Steel and Precast Concrete $15,401.97 $20,212.19 $15,401.97
Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238130 | Framing Contractors $2,234.30 $3,139.71 $2,234.30
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238140 | Masonry Contractors $1,900.60 $3,582.13 $1,900.60
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238150 | Glass and Glazing Contractors $5,255.36 $9,574.95 $5,255.36
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238160 | Roofing Contractors $3,589.99 $5,007.86 $3,589.99
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238170 | Siding Contractors $1,905.61 $2,485.86 $1,905.61
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238190 | Other Foundation; Structure; and $4,622.07 $4,141.38 $4,622.07
Building Exterior Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238210 | Electrical Contractors and Other $5,941.60 $9,599.33 $5,941.60
Wiring Installation Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238220 | Plumbing; Heating; and Air- $5,353.76 $11,047.00 $5,353.76
Conditioning Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238290 | Other Building Equipment $4,335.21 $16,142.07 $4,335.21
Contractors 2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR

Certified on 1/13/2022

14

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

2017 Industry Minor 0.3% of Avg Annual
NAICS Code NAICS Code Title Cost Estimate 1% of Avg Annual Payroll Gross Business Income
238310 | Drywall and Insulation Contractors $3,725.66 $9,461.67 $3,725.66
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
238990 | All Other Specialty Trade Contractors $3,585.74 $3,677.28 $3,585.74
2019 Dataset pulled from CBP 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
321213 | Engineered Wood Member (except $44,480.76 $44,480.76 $41,772.84
Truss) Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
321214 | Truss Manufacturing $28,620.35 $23,341.04 $28,620.35
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
321219 | Reconstituted Wood Product $30,305.17 $10,139.90 $30,305.17
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
321911 | Wood Window and Door $45,151.12 $18,811.08 $45,151.12
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
321992 | Prefabricated Wood Building $5,391.09 $5,391.09 $4,888.53
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
327310 | Cement Manufacturing $50,878.29 $44,741.20 $50,878.29
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
327320 | Ready-Mix Concrete Manufacturing $64,317.30 $46,126.21 $64,317.30
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
327331 | Concrete Block and Brick $15,030.60 $15,030.60 $10,431.02
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
332312 | Fabricated Structural Metal $22,220.31 $16,337.10 $22,220.31
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
332321 | Metal Window and Door $26,369.28 $14,505.40 $26,369.28
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
332322 | Sheet Metal Work Manufacturing $23,337.23 $23,337.23 $16,556.52
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
335121 | Residential Electric Lighting Fixture $2,011.37 $2,011.37 $1,502.01
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
335122 | Commercial; Industrial; and
Institutional Electric Lighting Fixture Redacted $6,357.34
Manufacturing $6,357.34 2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
335129 | Other Lighting Equipment $6,281.32 $6,281.32 $2,494.40
Manufacturing 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
423720 | Plumbing and Heating Equipment and $24,486.53 $16,589.10 $24,486.53
Supplies (Hydronics) Merchant 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
Wholesalers
541310 | Architectural Services $9,221.65 $9,221.65 $3,738.99
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
541330 | Engineering Services $14,801.92 $14,801.92 $7,177.43
2020 Dataset pulled from USBLS 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
541350 | Building Inspection Services $1,868.52 $1,868.52 $475.93
2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR
561621 | Security Systems Services (except $9,759.28 $9,759.28 $6,117.04
Locksmiths) 2020 Dataset pulled from ESD 2020 Dataset pulled from DOR

Estimate of the Number of Jobs That Will Be Created or Lost: The
adoption of the latest code edition is not expected to significantly
impact the number of jobs in the construction industry. These rules

are likely to be job neutral overall;
any Jjob gains or losses.
tion is July 1,
be vested under the 2018 building code.

2021.

i.e.,

they will not result in
The scheduled effective date of the new edi-
Building permits issued prior to that date will
Permits issued for projects

under the 2021 code edition will generally start with the 2024 con-
struction season.
A copy of the statement may be obtained by contacting Stoyan Bum-

balov,

1500 Jefferson Street S.E.,
3060-407-92717,

Certified on 1/13/2022

Olympia,
email stoyan.bumbalov@des.wa.gov.

WA 98504,

phone
December 30, 2021
Andrew S. Klein

Council Chair

WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040
OTS-3404.3

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-003 International Building Code. The ((2648)) 2021
edition of the International Building Code, including Appendix E, pub-
lished by the International Code Council is hereby adopted by refer-
ence with the exceptions noted in this chapter of the Washington Ad-
ministrative Code.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-003, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, S
51-50-003, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-003, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-003, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, §& 51-50-003,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.020,
19.27.031, 19.27.074 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 05-01-014,
§ 51-50-003, filed 12/2/04, effective 7/1/05. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.190, 19.27.020, and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 04-18-033,
§ 51-50-003, filed 8/25/04, effective 9/25/04. Statutory Authority:
RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-003, filed
12/17/03, effective 7/1/04.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 13-04-067, filed 2/1/13, effective
7/1/13)

WAC 51-50-005 International Building Code requirements for bar-
rier-free accessibility. Chapter 11 and other International Building
Code requirements for barrier-free access, including ICC
((AEF3+—2689)) Al17.1-2017 and Appendix E, are adopted pursuant to
chapters 70.92 and 19.27 RCW.

Pursuant to RCW 19.27.040, Chapter 11 and requirements affecting
barrier-free access shall not be amended by local governments.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW.
WSR 13-04-067, § 51-50-005, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory
Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and chapters 70.92, 19.27, and
34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-005, filed 12/19/06, effective
7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.020, 19.27.031, 19.27.074 and
chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 05-01-014, & 51-50-005, filed
12/2/04, effective 7/1/05. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.190,
19.27.020, and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 04-18-033, §
51-50-005, filed 8/25/04, effective 9/25/04. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-005, filed 12/17/03,
effective 7/1/04.]

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 16 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-03-064, filed 1/19/16, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-50-007 Exceptions. The exceptions and amendments to the
International Building Code contained in the provisions of chapter
19.27 RCW shall apply in case of conflict with any of the provisions
of these rules.

The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing
structures used solely for the commercial production of horticultural
plants including ornamental plants, flowers, vegetables, and fruits.
"Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and
roof covered with polyethylene, polyvinyl, or similar flexible syn-
thetic material and is used to provide plants with either frost pro-
tection or increased heat retention. A temporary growing structure is
not considered a building for purposes of this code.

The provisions of this code do not apply to the construction, al-
teration, or repair of temporary worker housing except as provided by
rule adopted under chapter 70.114A RCW or chapter 37, Laws of 1998 (SB
6168) . "Temporary worker housing”" means a place, area, or piece of
land where sleeping places or housing sites are provided by an employ-
er for his or her employees or by another person, including a tempora-
ry worker housing operator, who is providing such accommodations for
employees, for temporary, seasonal occupancy, and includes "labor
camps" under RCW 70.54.110.

Codes referenced which are not adopted through RCW 19.27.031 or
chapter 19.27A RCW shall not apply unless specifically adopted by the
authority having jurisdiction. The ((264+5)) 2021 International Exist-
ing Building Code is included in the adoption of this code in Section
101.4.7 and amended in WAC 51-50-480000.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-007, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-007, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-007, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, §& 51-50-007,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031
and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-007, filed 12/17/03, effective
7/1/04.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 21-11-066, filed 5/14/21, effective
6/14/21)

WAC 51-50-008 Implementation. The International Building Code
adopted under chapter 51-50 WAC shall become effective in all counties

and cities of this state on ((Febrvary—3++—>262%)) July 1, 2023.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 21-11-066, §
51-50-008, filed 5/14/21, effective 6/14/21; WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-008, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, S§
51-50-008, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-008, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-008, filed 1/20/10,

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 17 ] WSR 22-02-040



WSR 22-02-040

19.27.020,
§ 51-50-008,

Washington State Register

and

RCwW 19.27.074,
WSR 07-01-091,

Statutory Authority

effective 7/1/10.

and 34.05 RCW.

19.27,

chapters 70.92,

— O
™ >
O -H
e P
~ O
[Q\IN)
o
o)
— O
W ~
Om
o
~
oo [~
D>y
P
-—= N
S
(@)
S O
EERN())
=5
& -H
(O]
>
r ~
O o
PO
5 O
FEa |
© O
P 0
0 |
—
[NTe]
7
(@R
~
— o~
~ 00
~ O
—
(0]
>
-— O
FEa |
o <
0o
(O]
H oy
(O]
=
O .
o <
~ r~
o O
— .
~ r~
[Q\IQN]
— .
@)
O
(0]
— O
= O
H ©

7/1/04.]

-03-064, filed 1/19/16, effective

Amending WSR 16

(

AMENDATORY SECTION

7/1/16

)

WAC 51

stefagef

((

50-009
)) Reserved

1.7

1
T O T TOW

IS
cIIc

n

PR
[ wL s L_J.\Jll,

o £ +1h1 a0 o
OT— TS

o

IS LAY
CIIC PO pOoOoTo

+

r
O

i
T

(

(

Y AT AN o

ISR S~ - =
[SAT) TAS E NS RSLAS s S

o

138 syt +1 o4+

[SAwgn mgn sy w 3

raAan o

A

b3
(LIS 2 3 IOy S By WAV A Ay 8 By & A w & 3w =y wt

o

—

m

€OMPOST

T oOoST

T

CIIToa T

wWTro TT o

LRI
WTro T

S Al sz A

r
T

PN EEEZNENN

E|

o
[ S WA W W S I W s

S o

ISR Y
o O CTT

1y
E=Eas

IO yo Lok .

Nl Sl

FEAWAWAW S| N @ Fo N o) 7

o

ol oo

o1l a A

o
=}

r
T

o

S o

a1~
o O CTT

T 9T aoo .

e Tca o
ah 11

’

ST ey =

zi Aol £

POV IOUCTTT T O

DN

+1h o+ Y

o410 e

r
T

n o

P R [ R R

1

=
B WA Wy & i

o

O oTECT D

AT CIIoa C

[ 3 ¥ & iy mpn

JOoLr To U TITUITS

T T
ot

LRI
WTro T

134

[SF ¥ AW e ) W g ags sy w §

mi

o

311

a ot
A

aszoe ]
SR ASES

e

+ 1

[ g e

[ e

T TrTarLtoy CoOmMpPo oo Ty

jllIenw

T

A\

CIT

A=A E=e T

o

+ 1

Adocr~rn A+ ™ + 1 IS
ESASEERS AT S RS 1

12N

S okl o1 ]

o

r ey

ot

Th

crrc— T TtOo —OT cIrc—otTTT™

e T T

cO

[ i & ym mpm my

S CUTTO9YTT ol Tt

£~
\_/J—J——L\_/—L\_/J—J-\_/-Y

T

= Al
o

ISV L L R o ]
|SAYAERASL Ay e s 5 R ey

PN I I

=N
oo vao oo T

akh 11

= A

£ Al
g

neoesz

ooz

[T ¥ A S i & e e

IR %

PTITCyY 7

=) )

%)
<
o)
o
|
™M W
o
_ ~
O
— O
—
a |
0
= o
|
DESE
<O
7
oM
)]
~ =
2 .
o el <
o) O O
—
~ —
T
o~~~
© ™~
0]
— 0 >
™ > -H
o P
P O
~ 00
N O W
o 4 4y
AN H O
— QO
W ~™M
0 wWo
G — S~
~ ~
ee O)
D>y S~
PN
-~
S
0T T
Ne RN RN()
P~
S -
L Y
YI/
g o) o)
[cReoNe)
P OO
S0
P OO
@ 0O O
FEi
) —
—L0 L0

effective

filed 10/9/20,

(Amending WSR 20-21-021,

AMENDATORY SECTION

11/9/20)

-)) Reserved.

((

WAC 51-50-0110

0
it 1 A2~
OO iigsS

~

OO A

rh e

ot e~ o n

CUoOIrTocrraoc Tt Ultly

A iy

X737

O~

S A TX7

AW, o)

£ Mz~
T

wIrTC T T COoOTIrrctT

T

T

’

VT Ixy

A\ Type T+
IS I~ RN
TCT oo CcaorrctT

TT

T

PP IS, I B
C O T T OTITOOCTTr

PPt & TN
woOoOT—CTOVvCT

T

R

o

ot 1 o

+

n £
T TOTT

N

cO

oL proOvIOcTT Oy

T Ty o

S e s
+ 1

T.T

+ 1

EIEAW-E oo | n

A

n 2204 1

o T TITOIT

mant o

PRSI
J_\_,\i\/l._l_J_\./ll.l\./J.l )

akh 11

+

m

_I_J.J.g_)t/\./\./k.,_l_vl.l . LS i By AAVAWAW §
R L =
T

A\ U Te LU e Ly

P

I

meTTT

+

+ 1
OTCT

S Y7

+

A

o

N

+

Xz

o
T AL UL VAL w iy
R

+

m A

=N

+

Xz

o

TrIrocar oy | A 2w a7

0

ot Tt
S IR Pl Y

[ i & gm mpm my

O VT

A

o

o

o r 1 o o~
COVvVeT IS —OT

o

oL rlirocaoarrrcTTOs

T TIT T OoIIrco

7
WTr

o
=}

P
[SAAY =g =y e

a1l led ner

rat+ oA

1

+
T

N

n
A\ i g

r hale~

T oo
Ffrrnm Ao
T OTtt

Ik

LAFTY

cO

A

anA +h
T

WO IS Iy

A=

T T

OCTTIT

O

o S SRR

o C L O

LI R L RN

T r
O

a7 faRaY

T I3 M oY
TTTOWIITY

ot

T o Cc T Yty CIT cOoLT

O LI OW

TCrLTIly

O

C

|\ g

NN

Gt
IO 10 C T

o

17

rxzra

1M
T

o

Nratran~nt~A g

o

N

£t e

= [ g g

[\ @ i mn e

T—OTho

I~

SOy LT

C

o ML OIT

T oIty

T

WSR 22-02-040

18

Certified on 1/13/2022



WSR 22-02-040

Washington State Register

=

neo

o

Nt
TToOT

m_ah o1 1

TTT

asxzod
Oy o C

r
T

barra

KPR
P4 § P SN R U U g

o

17

1My 7o

+ 1

maon o

ITT

\PAWS S AW Wy @ gu i AW §

0

[\ & i S s [ ¥ & iy mpn m

TIMPoCT TV TOOO

CIT

A\

TITo

o

N 3o o
oo C— oo Lr L tCT o

o
pam ]

mih1 2

el
TaocCcCcUO aooCInoTr ooy

=

rat A

oo~
LT OO Lo CcAalilTcTc T

n £ 1
akh 11

N

n o

FEN

[SE AT Sy SATY 3 AR ep e g vl 3 yo

= A

n

W RN

T T 1L C

i

ot

EEE Wk

T.T

m  x7

£

Nt
ITOT

n o

P R

[SE AT BN 1A R ) Sy S e a e ny e a v p 3 yo

am

TITop T ToTT™

vV LTTW L % 3 W g

T OTIr

[ WA NSRS WA WS i A WA Wy & i B WA W §

[ 3 & gm mpm my

Tnaad

1T~ ~190A

wrat+lh Ol ot~ 12 S A Al ]
u

WL CIT

comanT 1 o~

rm o
() N L S By 1 3 B A SR SR w4 3 3 T mpm Ep o i 3 3 e

NI IO R

ToOT—OoCT
Tlmxz 13-

|4

C

EwAwS

TrIrocTraacy

(& T ¥ A S i & e g

T T T

n
T CTT

o

vaLroacoy

= Al
T

I»)

Y

n

P I
i S N AN i U R Ay & N U S N B

n

. Tz~ ]
TV eTopPpT

+
O T .

n o

]

EEE Wk

TITo P T T TTTUITS

7

J E iy 3 3 B W WA W

PN TS

o

N

P |
O T T C 1TTT T

Ingg g T Ao~
cc—oa LT a5

+ 1

PN 2N e A e S 0]

+
CIr-OTgTT

o1 ~Arnae 170 2
oC T TTOTS

n
i

T CIiroOT

0

T T U eI Uy

T T U e I e L

+

PR NES)
WO

n

Atz o~ Not v~ o
(.A.J.J._Y CUT o C T OCTTITOUIT
£ 1o

A\

no £+
O

EIEAW-E oo |

+

PRSI
J_\_,\i\/l._l_J_\_, L\ U i B u

r

m

o +

N

cO

TITo P T T TTTUITS

oSS O

cO

T—Z T

1 a7 a

+h o

Ay

aond
COoOCC——TaG—oOTICT
anf otz

n o

Nz oo

R 2

RICIE I~ SN 0 2
W I CIt
+ 1

min] 1 S~
A=A T2 113 ===y 2 3 § w2 =

n
| = 3 S SR S i g E g S S S

o

PNPINE S SSENE IR
o T T T CTrITIT
T NP

TTEW O

CITT 15
P PO I [ [
g

CIIrC POV oLt UInsS

a sz dornartman+

o

o

oSO LTy .

oo Oy

| S SRR A ) The = mp e 11y 5 g e

CIIToa C

PRSI
J_\_,\i\A_LJ_\./\.A.

P |
|7 S S S U Sy 6 R b/J__I_UJ_

+

el

ot £ r
TOWC ST

T.T

P S

cCIrc— T vaoCcITUOIT

At~

SoTTOmCITcaoa c o OTT

]

o1im
o T TITOIT

o 3
arcdy

TOO

S S W W

cIr
+ 1

A\

R SN I S R I
o O TIT T T O T

O
akh 11

r

N

Ingg g 1 Ao~
cHrc—ou LT a5

=N

1612 A

n

O

cO

0T

[ I Y & ym mpm

.

etionr))

EEESWLN
TSP CTTOT~

£

+ 1

S S s i @ i

I

S

WSR 20-21-021,

RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074.

[Statutory Authority

effective 11/9/20.]

filed 10/9/20,

51-50-0110,

, effective

filed 6/2/21

103,

(Amending WSR 21-12-

AMENDATORY SECTION

7/3/21)

Definitions.

WAC 51-50-0200 Chapter 2

SECTION 202—DEFINITIONS.

licensed by the state of Washington depart-

A dwelling,
ment of social and health services,

vide personal care,

ADULT FAMILY HOME .

in which a person or persons pro-

room and board to more than one but

An existing adult family

special care,
home may provide services to up to eight adults upon approval from the

department of social and health services in accordance with RCW

not more than six adults who are not related by blood or marriage to
70.128.066.

the person or persons providing the services.

licensed by the state

A home or other institution,

providing housing,

ASSISTED LIVING FACILITY.
of Washington,

basic services and assuming general

responsibility for the safety and well-being of residents under chap-

ters 18.20 RCW and 388-78A WAC.

These facilities may provide care to

residents with symptoms consistent with dementia requiring additional

security measures.

A system designed to manage electrical

load across one or more EV Ready parking spaces.

AUTOMATIC LOAD MANAGEMENT SYSTEM (ALMS) .

WSR 22-02-040

19

Certified on 1/13/2022



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

BOTTLE FILLING STATION. A plumbing fixture connected to the potable water
distribution system and sanitary drainage system that is designed and
intended for filling personal use drinking water bottles or containers
not less than 10 inches (254 mm) in height. Such fixtures can be sepa-
rate from or integral to a drinking fountain and can incorporate a wa-
ter filter and a cooling system for chilling the drinking water.

cHip carRe. The care of children during any period of a 24-hour day.

CHILD CARE, FAMILY HOME. A child care facility, licensed by Washington state,
located in the dwelling of the person or persons under whose direct
care and supervision the child is placed, for the care of twelve or
fewer children, including children who reside at the home.

CLIMATE ZONE. A geographical region that has been assigned climatic crite-
ria as specified in the Washington State Energy Code.

cruster. Clusters are multiple portable school classrooms separated by
less than the requirements of the building code for separate build-
ings.

composTt. Biodegradable solid wastes that are separated for composting
such as food waste, food soiled paper, and yvard waste.

EFFICIENCY DWELLING UNIT. A dwelling unit where all permanent provisions for
living, sleeping, eating and cooking are contained in a single room.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CAPABLE PARKING SPACE. A parking space provided with a con-
duit, electrical panel and load capacity to support future installa-
tion of EV charging egquipment.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) cHARGER. Off-board charging equipment used to charge elec-
tric vehicles.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) CHARGING STATION. EV Ready parking space with installed EV
charger.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE (EV) READY PARKING SPACE. A parking space provided with a recepta-
cle outlet allowing charging of electric vehicles.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE SUPPLY EQUIPMENT (EVSE) . The conductors, including the ungrounded,
grounded, and equipment grounding conductors, and the electric vehicle
connectors, attachment plugs, personnel protection system, and all
other fittings, devices, power outlets, or apparatus installed specif-
ically for the purpose of transferring enerqy between the premises
wiring and the electric vehicle.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor, located more than 75
feet (22,860 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle ac-—
cess. For the purposes of this definition, an occupied roof with an
occupant load of 50 or more is considered to be an occupied floor.

HOSPICE CARE CENTER. A building or portion thereof used on a 24-hour basis
for the provision of hospice services to terminally ill inpatients.

LoFT. A space on an intermediate level or levels between the floor and

ceiling of a Group R occupancy dwelling or sleeping unit, open on one
or more sides to the room in which the loft is located, and in accord-
ance with Section 420.13.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 20 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

NiGETCLUB. An A-2 Occupancy ( (gse—under—the 2006—TInternational Buitding

€ode)) in which the aggregate area of concentrated use of unfixed
chairs and standing space that is specifically designated and primari-
ly used for dancing or viewing performers exceeds three hundred fifty
square feet, excluding adjacent lobby areas. "Nightclub" does not in-
clude theaters with fixed seating, banquet halls, or lodge halls.

PORTABLE SCHOOL CLAsSSsRooM. A prefabricated structure consisting of one or more
rooms with direct exterior egress from the classroom(s). The structure
is transportable in one or more sections and is designed to be used as
an educational space with or without a permanent foundation. The
structure shall be capable of being demounted and relocated to other
locations as needs arise.

RECYCLED MATERIALS. Those solid wastes that are separated for recycling or
reuse, such as papers, metals, and glass.

RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING SUITES. A unit that provides multiple rooms or spaces for
up to five residents, includes provisions for sleeping and can include
provisions for living, eating, sanitation, and kitchen facilities.

sSMALL BUSINESS. Any business entity (including a sole proprietorship, cor-

poration, partnership or other legal entity) which is owned and oper-

ated independently from all other businesses, which has the purpose of
making a profit, and which has fifty or fewer employees.

sTaceD EvacuaTION. A method of emergency response, that engages building
components and trained staff to provide occupant safety during an
emergency. Emergency response involves moving or holding certain occu-
pants at temporary locations for a brief period of time before evacu-
ating the building. This response is used by ambulatory surgery fa-
cility and assisted living facilities to protect the health and safety
of fragile occupants and residents.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 21-12-103, §
51-50-0200, filed 6/2/21, effective 7/3/21; WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0200, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0200, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0200, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.074, 19.27.020, and 19.27.031. WSR 14-24-089, § 51-50-0200,
filed 12/1/14, effective 5/1/15. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031
and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, § 51-50-0200, filed
2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and
19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0200, filed 1/20/10, effective
7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.190, 19.27.020, and chapters
19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 08-01-110, § 51-50-0200, filed 12/18/07, ef-
fective 4/1/08. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 21 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-0200,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.020,
19.27.031, 19.27.074, and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 05-24-070,
§ 51-50-0200, filed 12/5/05, effective 7/1/06. Statutory Authority:
RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-0200, filed
12/17/03, effective 7/1/04.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-03-064, filed 1/19/16, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-50-0306 Section 306—Factory Group F.

306.2 Moderate-hazard factory industrial, Group F-1. Factory industri-
al uses that are not classified as factory industrial F-2 low hazard
shall be classified as F-1 moderate hazard and shall include, but not
be limited to, the following:

Aircraft (manufacturing, not to include repair)

Appliances

Athletic equipment

Automobiles and other motor vehicles

Bakeries

Beverages: Over 16 percent alcohol content

Bicycles

Boats

Brooms or brushes

Business machines

Cameras and photo equipment

Canvas or similar fabric

Carpets and rugs (includes cleaning)

Clothing

Construction and agricultural machinery

Disinfectants

Dry cleaning and dyeing

Electric generation plants

Electronics

Energy storage systems (ESS) in dedicated use buildings

Engines (including rebuilding)

Food processing establishments and commercial kitchens not asso-
ciated with restaurants, cafeterias and similar dining facilities more

than 2,500 square feet (232m?) in area
Furniture
Hemp products
Jute products
Laundries
Leather products
Machinery
Marijuana processing
Metals
Millwork (sash and door)
Motion pictures and television filming (without spectators)
Musical instruments
Optical goods
Paper mills or products
Photographic film
Plastic products

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 22 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Printing or publishing
Recreational vehicles
Refuse incineration
Shoes

Soaps and detergents
Textiles

Tobacco

Trailers

Upholstering
Water/sewer treatment facilities
Wood; distillation
Woodworking (cabinet)

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0306, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-21-021, filed 10/9/20, effective
11/9/20)

WAC 51-50-0308 Section 308—Institutional Group I.

PN £ ol f o~~~z P
L TT ut/uL/_L g =] J S t/J_ =] [ S VA €7 N U S N iy
Mads oo PIENE

T A\ i L& g L& g = .

Nursing—hemes~) )

308.2 Institutional Group I-1. Institutional Group I-1 occupancy shall
include buildings, structures or portions thereof for more than six-
teen persons, excluding staff, who reside on a twenty-four-hour basis
in a supervised environment and receive custodial care. Buildings of
Group I-1 shall be classified as one of the occupancy conditions
specified in Section 308.2.1 or 308.2.2 and shall comply with Section
420. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug centers;

Assisted living facilities as licensed by Washington state under
chapter 388-78A WAC;

Congregate care facilities;

Group homes;

Halfway houses;

Residential board and care facilities;

Social rehabilitation facilities;

Residential treatment facilities as licensed by Washington state
under chapter 246-337 WAC.

308.2.5 Adult family homes. Adult family homes licensed by Washington
state shall be classified as Group R-3 or shall comply with the Inter-
national Residential Code.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 23 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

308.2.6 Licensed care facilities. Assisted living facilities as 1li-
censed by Washington state under chapter 388-78A WAC shall be classi-
fied as Group I-1, Condition 2.

Residential treatment facilities licensed by Washington state un-
der chapter 246-337 WAC shall be classified as one or more occupancy
types in accordance with chapter 246-337 WAC.

308.3 Institutional Group I-2. Institutional Group I-2 occupancy shall
include buildings and structures used for medical care on a 24-hour
basis for more than five persons who are incapable of self-preserva-
tion. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Foster care facilities.

Detoxification facilities.

Hospice care centers.

Hospitals.

Nursing homes.

Psychiatric hospitals.

308.5.5 Family home child care. Family home child care licensed by
Washington state for the care of twelve or fewer children shall be
classified as Group R-3 or shall comply with the International Resi-
dential Code.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-21-021, §
51-50-0308, filed 10/9/20, effective 11/9/20; WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0308, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0308, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0308, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0308, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-0308,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031
and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-0308, filed 12/17/03, effective
7/1/04.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-0309 Section 309—Mercantile Group M.

309.1 Mercantile Group M. Mercantile Group M occupancy includes, among
others, the use of a building or structure or a portion thereof for
the display and sale of merchandise, and involves stocks of goods,
wares or merchandise incidental to such purposes and ((aeeessible—+te))
where the public has access. Mercantile occupancies shall include, but
not be limited to, the following:

Art galleries 3,000 square feet or less;

Department stores;

Drug stores;

Markets;

Greenhouses for display and sale of plants that provide public

Motor fuel-dispensing facilities;

L]
L]
L]
L]
L]
access;
L]
* Retail or wholesale stores;

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 24 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

e Sales rooms.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0309, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 21-06-035, filed 2/23/21, effective
3/26/21)

WAC 51-50-0310 Section 310—Residential Group R.

310.3 Residential Group R-2. Residential occupancies containing sleep-
ing units or more than two dwelling units where the occupants are pri-
marily permanent in nature, including:

Apartment houses

( (Poarding—houses—rentransientr—with more than T6—occedparnts))

Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with more than 16 oc-
cupants

Boarding houses (nontransient)

Convents

Dormitories

Fraternities and sororities

Monasteries

Hotels (nontransient)

Live/work units

( (Merastexies))

Motels (nontransient)

Vacation timeshare properties

310.4.3 Adult family homes, family home child care. Adult family homes
and family home child care facilities that are within a single-family
home are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code.

310.4.4 Foster family care homes. Foster family care homes licensed by
Washington state are permitted to comply with the International Resi-
dential Code, as an accessory use to a dwelling, for six or fewer
children including those of the resident family.

310.5 Residential Group R-4. R-4 classification is not adopted. Any
reference in this code to R-4 does not apply.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 21-06-035, §
51-50-0310, filed 2/23/21, effective 3/26/21; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0310, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0310, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0310, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.190, 19.27.020, and
chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 08-01-110, § 51-50-0310, filed
12/18/07, effective 4/1/08. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074,
19.27.020, and chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, §
51-50-0310, filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 04-01-108, § 51-50-0310, filed 12/17/03,
effective 7/1/04.]

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 25 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-0403 Section 403—High-rise buildings.

=~ . ADN £ + (1 2Q 1\ IR~ P I B I AR 1 xh+ A a2 T A s £

T T TTTT T A4 - T \J_ A4 ll.l/ J S .L/LA_L_Lu_L.lJy .l.L\_,_Ly.l.LL,, (@R EAw LJL/I._L_L\A._LJ.J.&»_} g
Mz i W A NN N S o W o B S “NENE RN PANE +harn 19590 £ £ o gt T NI oy N S
J__Yt/ 1V Fany BN AW 1V gy CTIITT T & T 1T CITTTT - A4 - T [ S .L/L,{_L_L\_A_Lllg .l.L\_,_Lg.l.LL,, 1T
1t road £ o nmea ah 17 1 PR EE SN I A Wz SN~~~ o nea o+ Nt Foargae o
\.iu_LJ_ oL [ S t/ull.lt/g) [S5J N I & Ry S Ly uut/t/_L_L oL J\J_Y OTITIT CTTUTThO Ry o T - \AU - CITTTT
1 PICENE SN NE S SN I N | PN SN B IR A I = NP NEENE SR i + QNN FE LN I T 2 E IR 2N I 2
CTWF WL T - T TTTTWO [ . [ oL [ S |\ N E S - ITC [ e ) J t/(.A.J_(./LL., uut/t/_L_Y t/_Lt/_LJ.lv
alho171 Nraosrzr o At ~ N N R T~ I CN +h PICENE SNSRI SN IE NI NE 2N B L 2

[S5J W I & Ry S Ly t/J_UV_L\A. oL Ly TV T L T OITTTT CITUTT R CTT W CT - 35 § & Ry S g Sy aw s CTT

- aakan Ly =) ot alhalWal o - o Y - 1 - 1 ala - el o ) 1 o
oS a O O Suzaw HoP+—vV—P3P g O o
ENEA I N 2N nmea ah 17 1 a1 oA 4+ a1l sz + 1 Floatgr A N~ g N E I R |
sy sw s CTT t/ulllt/u [S5J W I & Ry S Ly [ mpyary oL R uut/t/_L_Y CTT 1T OW Sy aw s t/J_ [ W g - \.iu_LJ_ A8
oy + Siimrma N

[ S N CTT t/ulllt/u R \Jt/ T

EXCEPTION: © o-th

403.5.4 Smokeproof enclosures. Every required interior exit stairway
serving floors more than 75 feet (22,860 mm) above the lowest level of
fire department vehicle access shall be a smokeproof enclosure in ac-
cordance with Sections 909.20 and ((#623-3++)) 1023.12. Where interior
exit stairways and ramps are pressurized in accordance with Section
909.20.5, the smoke control pressurization system shall comply with
the requirements specified in Section 909.6.3.

403.4.8.3 Standby power loads. The following are classified as standby
power loads:

1. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smoke-
proof enclosures.

2. Elevators.

3. Where elevators are provided in a high-rise building for ac-
cessible means of egress, fire service access or occupant self-evacua-
tion, the standby power system shall also comply with Sections 1009.4,
3007 or 3008, as applicable.

4. Sump pumps required by ASME Al7.1 serving pit drains at the
bottom of elevator hoistways of fire service access or occupant evacu-
ation elevators.

( ne N OO o o ] A

O PO oSy 4 a
] RN IR 2 W-NE N +hoarn 210 £ + (0144 )Y Wl ~rg + 1 Farntabh A £17 ~ £ 1+
i A\ Ju =y T 1T CTIITTAIT AV - C \ [ S G § ll.lll.l/ Ly OV CTT S S N R R END 0 A oL [ S N N g [N Sy
] tze ] £ 1+ Ao~y ah 11 come sz o2+ 1 BN LI BV S N ST S N SN
- \4 - g [ |\ g =y J.L(_A.J_v [S5J W I & Ry S \Jlllt/_L_Y W I CTT CTT - \.iu_LJ_ TIT TT TS [ S N (=5
amal nr £ ne ] ISR NP CNE Y T A D N QN S na ONAQ 20 A T A2 117 WhA
[SFyssw ) t/J_UUJ_ T [ SN NS I U g [ ) t/J_UV_L\A. oL 1T - CTTUTTHhO A4 . A4 Sy aw s ENa vy e L T LAETY -
EIEAE —NE N o~ EIE SR SIENE EEES S NE £ R NE NP RSN\ 2 E CNp SN PP W-E LS 2N B I NP MPNE 2 N SN 1 +h
T TTC [ S N N [ UL.,(.A._LJ_VV(.A._YU Sy aw s J_(.A.lllt/k.) L& g = t/J_ oo U T 720 oL [ S (=5 LT ATTT W I CTT
(@I S n 0O0N0Q 2N B + 1 amal N N S N I N P NP W= N N n aszat+ro~m oh~171 anmr <z
J CTUTT A4 . Uo\J, CTT [SFyssw ) UITC IO t/J_ oo U0 T2 TCITTOUTT U_YUL_, TIT [ N I & Ry S ulllt/_L_Y
PO AT~ SN IR IRV L NP I =i B B IS QNPT S H- NN O W A N O N/ AN ]
W LT CTT CIT 1 \.iu_LJ_ TTT TT TS ut/ [ S S oL 1T J CTUTT A4 A\ 4

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0403, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0403, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0403, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0403, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0403, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10.]

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 26 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040
NEW SECTION

WAC 51-50-0405 Section 405—Underground buildings.

405.7.2 Smokeproof enclosure. Every required stairway serving floor
levels more than 30 feet (9144 mm) below the finished floor of its
level of exit discharge shall comply with the requirements for a
smokeproof enclosure as provided in Sections 909.20 and 1023.12. Where
interior exit stairways and ramps are pressurized in accordance with
Section 909.20.5, the smoke control pressurization system shall comply
with the requirements specified in Section 909.6.3.

[]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0407, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0407, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0407, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0407, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-0407,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.020,
19.27.031, 19.27.074 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 05-01-014,
§ 51-50-0407, filed 12/2/04, effective 7/1/05.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 21-06-035, filed 2/23/21, effective
3/26/21)

WAC 51-50-0412 Section 412—Aircraft-related occupancies.

412.2.2.1 Stairways. Stairways in airport traffic control towers shall
be in accordance with Section 1011. Exit stairways shall be smokeproof
enclosures complying with one of the alternatives provided in Section

909.20. Where interior exit stairways and ramps are pressurized in ac-
cordance with Section 909.20.5, the smoke control pressurization sys-

tem shall comply with the requirements specified in Section 909.6.3.

[F] 412.7.3 Means of egress. The means of egress from heliports, heli-
pads and helistops shall comply with the provisions of Chapter 10.
Landing areas located on buildings or structures shall have two or
more ( (means—ef—egress)) exits or access to exits. For landing areas
less than 60 feet in length or less than 2,000 square feet (186 m?) in
area, the second means of egress is permitted to be a fire escape, al-
ternating tread device or ladder leading to the floor below. On Group

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 27 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

I-2 roofs with heliports or helipads and helistops, rooftop structures
enclosing exit stair enclosures or elevator shafts shall be enclosed
with fire barriers and opening protectives that match the rating of
their respective shaft enclosures below.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 21-06-035, §
51-50-0412, filed 2/23/21, effective 3/26/21; WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0412, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0412, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16.]

Reviser's note: The brackets and enclosed material in the text of the above section occurred in
the copy filed by the agency.

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-0420 Section 420—Groups I-1, R-1, R-2, R-3.

420.2 Separation walls. Walls separating dwelling units in the same
building, walls separating sleeping units in the same building and
walls separating dwelling or sleeping units from other occupancies
contiguous to them in the same building shall be constructed as fire
partitions in accordance with Section 708. Buildings containing multi-
ple sleeping units with common use or central kitchens shall not be
classified as a single dwelling.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Where sleeping units include private bathrooms, walls between bedrooms and the associated private bathrooms are not required to be
constructed as fire partitions.
2. Where sleeping units are constructed as suites, walls between bedrooms within the sleeping unit and the walls between the bedrooms
and associated living spaces are not required to be constructed as fire partitions.
3. In Groups R-3 facilities, walls within the dwelling units or sleeping units are not required to be constructed as fire partitions.
4. Groups R-2 and I-1 arranged into residential sleeping suites containing a maximum of five sleeping residents. Separation between
bedrooms, living areas and toilet rooms within these residential sleeping suites shall not be required.
5. Group I-1 sleeping areas arranged so that a dedicated staff member has direct observation over a multiple resident sleeping room,
without intervening full height walls, shall not be required to provide fire partitions within the resident sleeping area.

((420-31)) 420.12 Adult family homes. This section shall apply to all
newly constructed adult family homes and all existing single-family
homes being converted to adult family homes. This section shall not
apply to those adult family homes licensed by the state of Washington
department of social and health services prior to July 1, 2001.

((420-311-2%)) 420.12.1 Sleeping room classification. Each sleeping room
in an adult family home shall be classified as one of the following:

1. Type S - Where the means of egress contains stairs, elevators
or platform lifts.

2. Type NS1 - Where one means of egress is at grade level or a
ramp constructed in accordance with Section ((426=+8)) 1012 is provi-
ded.

3. Type NS2 - Where two means of egress are at grade level or
ramps constructed in accordance with Section ((4260-+7%8)) 1012 are pro-
vided.

((420-311-2)) 420.12.2 Types of locking devices and door activation.
All bedrooms and bathroom doors shall be openable from the outside
when locked.
Every closet door shall be readily openable from the inside.
Operable parts of door handles, pulls, latches, locks and other
devices installed in adult family homes shall be operable with one
hand and shall not require tight grasping, pinching, or twisting of

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 28 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

the wrist. Pocket doors shall have graspable hardware available when
in the closed or open position.

The force required to activate operable parts shall be 5.0 pounds
(22.2 N) maximum. Required exit door(s) shall have no additional lock-
ing devices. Required exit door hardware shall unlock inside and out-
side mechanisms when exiting the building allowing reentry into the
adult family home without the use of a key, tool or special knowledge.

((420-311-3)) 420.12.3 Smoke and carbon monoxide alarm requirements.
Alarms shall be installed in such a manner so that the detection de-
vice warning is audible from all areas of the dwelling upon activation
of a single alarm.

((420-311-4)) 420.12.4 Escape windows and doors. Every sleeping room
shall be provided with emergency escape and rescue windows as required
by Section 1030. No alternatives to the sill height such as steps,
raised platforms or other devices placed by the openings will be ap-
proved as meeting this requirement.

((420-311-5)) 420.12.5 Grab bar general requirements. Where facilities
are designated for use by adult family home clients, grab bars for wa-
ter closets, bathtubs and shower stalls shall be installed according
to ICC All7.1.

((420-11-6)) 420.12.6 Shower stalls. Where provided to meet the re-
quirements for bathing facilities, the minimum size of shower stalls
for an adult family home shall be 30 inches deep by 48 inches long.

((420-312)) 420.13 Licensed care cooking facilities. In Group I-1, Con-
dition 2 assisted living facilities licensed under chapter 388-78A WAC
and residential treatment facilities licensed under chapter 246-337
WAC, rooms or spaces that contain a cooking facility with domestic
cooking appliances shall be permitted to be open to the corridor where
all of the following criteria are met:

1. The number of care recipients housed in the smoke compartment
is not greater than 30.

2. The number of care recipients served by the cooking facility
is not greater than 30.

3. Only one cooking facility area is permitted in a smoke com-
partment.

4. The types of domestic cooking appliances permitted are limited
to ovens, cooktops, ranges, warmers and microwaves.

5. The corridor is a clearly identified space delineated by con-
struction or floor pattern, material or color.

6. The space containing the domestic cooking facility shall be
arranged so as not to obstruct access to the required exit.

7. A domestic cooking hood installed and constructed in accord-
ance with Section 505 of the International Mechanical Code is provided
over the cooktop or range.

8. The domestic cooking hood provided over the cooktop or range
shall be equipped with an automatic fire-extinguishing system of a
type recognized for protection of domestic cooking equipment. Preengi-
neered automatic extinguishing systems shall be tested in accordance
with UL 300A and listed and labeled for the intended application. The
system shall be installed in accordance with this code, its listing
and the manufacturer's instructions.

9. A manual actuation device for the hood suppression system
shall be installed in accordance with Sections ( (8643 2—F+—-and
804-12-2)) 904.13.1 and 904.13.2.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 29 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

10. An interlock device shall be provided such that upon activa-
tion of the hood suppression system, the power or fuel supply to the
cooktop or range will be turned off.

11. A shut-off for the fuel and electrical power supply to the
cooking equipment shall be provided in a location that is accessible
only to staff.

12. A timer shall be provided that automatically deactivates the
cooking appliances within a period of not more than 120 minutes.

13. A portable fire extinguisher shall be installed in accordance
with Section 906 of the International Fire Code.

420.14 Lofts. Where provided in Group R occupancies, lofts shall com-
ply with this code as modified by Sections 420.14.1 through 420.14.5.
Lofts constructed in compliance with this section shall be considered
a portion of the story below. Such Jofts shall not contribute to ei-
ther the building area or number of stories as requlated by Section
503.1. The loft floor area shall be included in determining the fire
area.

EXCEPTION: Lofts need not comply with Section 420.13 where they meet any of the following conditions:

1. The /oft has a maximum depth of less than 3 feet (914 mm).

2. The loft has a floor area of less than 35 square feet (3.3 m?).

3. The loft is not provided with a permanent means of egress.

420.14.1 Loft limitations. ILofts shall comply with the following con-—
ditions:
1. The Joft floor area shall be less than 70 sgquare feet (6.5

m2}.

2. The loft ceiling height shall not exceed 7 feet (2134 mm) for
more than one-half of the loft floor area.

The provisions of Sections 420.14.2 through 420.14.5 shall not
apply to lofts that do not comply with Ttems 1 and 2.

420.14.2 Loft ceiling height. The ceiling height below a loft shall
not be less than 7 feet (2134 mm). The ceiling height above the fin-
ished floor of the Joft shall not be less than 3 feet (914 mm). Por-
tions of the loft with a sloped ceiling measuring less than 3 feet
(914 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not
contribute to the loft floor area.

420.14.3 Loft area. The aggregate area of all lofts and mezzanines
within a room shall comply with Section 505.2.1.

EXCEPTION: The area of a single loft shall not be greater than two-thirds of the area of the room in which it is located, provided that no other lofts or
mezzanines are open to the room in which the /oft is located.

420.14.4 Permanent egress for lofts. Where a permanent means of egress
is provided for Iofts, the means of egress shall comply with Chapter
10 as modified by Section 420.14.4.1.

420.14.4.1 Ceiling height at loft means of egress. A minimum ceiling
height of 3 feet shall be provided for the entire width of the means
of egress from the Ioft.

420.14.5 Smoke alarms. Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall
be installed in all Iofts in accordance with Section 907.2.11.1 or
907.2.11.2.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0420, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0420, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 30 ] WSR 22-02-040



WSR 22-02-040

Washington State Register

: RCW

iled 1/20/10,

-0420,

Statutory Authority
50 f

effective 7/1/13.
03-097, § 51-

WSR 10-

.074.

27

filed 2/1/13,

031 and 19

27

51-50-0420,

19

effective 7/1/10.]

effective

filed 7/29/21,

(Amending WSR 21-16-063,

AMENDATORY SECTION

8/29/21)

ing infra-

429—Electric vehicle chargi

WAC 51-50-0429 Section

structure.

PENE= NN B B 22N R = +
el S S

CTOTT

o

+1h 2

n o

-1

o

-1

AT

Th

1T

OTT

CIT

[ i Y & gm mpm cO

=}

CIT IO

A\

POV o ITUTS

+ 1

WL CITl

dod 1g-

POV IOUTTE

a ah o171 nraosza
[ RS i & i mp mp )

QN
O OTET

noraoan £ ~orlea o~y
AN S STA Y ¥ I SR O Ry S 4 i S Ny A

Sad

o pLrOoOvIaOcTy

73

i

ot 2 Ao
o CtCTTOTS

+h <

W LT CIT

1.7

min ] 2 S~
(AT 13y = umpn my e 3 3 5 w7

o

o N M
[ S N R i Sy & STWD I USRN S U ) P U U g

1

1 ey

alh o e o

1

KRy, W R

ot

1

LTIt

Cao g9
420 B

s e e
(&5 ¥ AW S 4

A\ W e W \

420 2

a1+ o
[ W I Sy e )

r oA Iz r
A\ S

i

n
ah 11

+ P IDR, I
CTT

Whoan

VVIT

= A

4
T

420

T

T =

CorrC oo c It OIT

T

)

11

4

12 A
Tooa—apP

r

LIPS

S|
P TrCaitt

ERNE N NN N o IR NN
rTraCtTcTroaoTr paLr Tty

Eon ~t

n
LTIt

CIT

cO

[ ) & i mg uy

CIT

’

O oTCT

(&3

1

EEY
Ircrraor

At

mmada o+ + 1
cO—a C oMot T

o

mitat I
jllavye

o
=}

QI
O oTECT

1 ey

o+l

O

CIT

A=

[ wpyary
Ik

0

POy

O L

OTT

Mmoo g oy

T C T T CITTCIrr

=
(&3

Iz

1 o +

o411 a

r
T

n

4

EN P AP S
(S35 A S & e my s g mp np ) S

At

T

PSR I I X 2
AT 1

1

ERP_Y

ot

A\

cO

A=

AT

C

T

o R BN
[ S N R i Sy & STWD I USRN S U B P U U g

1oy oo

alh o vy

1

Py T

ot

] At

o1 37

T T Tty

\ s e e

A\ W e

A

ERPE TN N |
verC T

ot e

=]

B i N W W S i

1 rer

narls
CIIT po LISty

1

Iz

roeyiaa vl
T

n o

a4
o COCITTUTTOS

1 ey

alh o e o

1

P T

ot

\w 8

AT

CTrIo 9Tty

Y s e e

A\ W e W

1 ey

alh o e o

3

K
VoITTI oo oo gTrity

Xz

3

ot
T T

QA+ a -~ 420 9 Th
o tCTTOT—T=Z

4

[ S e g m W) e w8

ah 11

o
=}

QI

T

T I

O oTCT

o Al
T

) +od £ o Te o oy

Qg ooe

A

o
=}

QN

Iz

b

n o
CcC OIS

\w 8 O oTCT T o Tyl cTo T UL palr sty

T OoOTCTTT

[ 3} & i mps S )

o

1

3

K
v CTrS S

P e

1

1 ey

alh o ey

CrorrgTritly oo o T T

EEaY

E=

ra

m

oot

57 N

oC LT VvVvICCT CaopaCTCyy

O YN~ o

o rxzra o~

n

el el

P W A W i B W i W i i @ e

N AA

[ S B U O R S wy J.I.l\_zl_\_/J.Q, b/L/LJ.l\_/.L
£

O

OO

z

O YN~ o

1
LTIt

oot

r

T ISz

o

r
oIS TaCTWay o

o ot

o

=

E=

n

4

S A4
[SAS A =S E TS 3 1S gu Ry S4S ¥ ¥ A S 7

r
O

+ <z E - B N
O

P B R

ToCcorc

O

OO

+ 5z

oL vICCT CopaoltTCy

oot

O YN~ o

rxzra o~

o

n o

4

O COaOCLUOITo -

1 ey

ah o e o

1

W~
VoITTI oo oo gty

P e
| \SP Nl WP Wy SR S S Wy
1

n

4

oCcaL LtacCcTtOIT

T
+ 1

A\

17 o
LTTTOo CO L 1TTTH

1o

Ao

mmm
cCO—o C T oot TT

==

Qe

A

ah 11

=1

T IS Z Y

o

1
oI tacTway

ToCcorcT

CcII

[} 3 1@ = N Ry UA SR v A g mps b i ) w ¥

O L LT

ok I A
cTrc T T

At

P

CHO T VO T TITC

+ r
Ao m
420 2

A\ s B WP w e e

A0 — o I

AWA

£ 209 /24N

1+
A .
o ot

N1

K
cIIc

+

n
CTOTT

(=333 =47

TTornno T

A\

1

T I SZ

r

n

+
o T T OIT

o

n

QA

n o

4

o CcaCcCLUOITo

1 ey

alh o e o

3

1SN
VoITTI o T T oo gty

Iz

T CcTway

T

[ S\ e g m m W) e w8

+ oo

o

12 ~1

IS
v CTCS

Iz

TocCcorcTs

CcII<

LTIt

Szt

o Iz
oL ve  TxXTT

n o

R,
LT OCT T T ITUTTS

1 ey

alh o e o

12 ~1

1SN
VoITTI oo oo gty

o PP

: + o lect s ~ g

Qg ooe

haor

JAR T AR "I RER A YU BT § 3 § & 5 S W) W S wepe S W) U e mp e

=

m

£

+h o

r

] antas e

o

EIE AW Sk N D =]

A N+l

r
S S g

oL ot ctCo 1o PP 5 N & 5 T T OTITT

CIIaoa T

gLraucTT PO ISty OPTETCTS

OTT

n o

R,
LT OC T T ITTUTTS

1 ey

alh o e o

12 ~1

ok
VT IO k/J.J.L/LJ.\j.LJ.l\j

3

ot

PR R =T S
T M\_/Q.L\jllul_\_/u [ SN U R U U R S ) | \EP Ei WP Wy SR S S Wy

Qg ooe

57

VoI Cy

EE I I |

A
SN

3

ot

PR R =2 P
T M\_/Q.L\jllul_\_/u [ S U R U U R S ) | \EP Ei WP Wy WS S S Wy

Qg ooe

57

VoI Cy

L T B |

+ 1

n

oA ]

Xz

el

A\

CcII

LTIt

O COrT arouUveT graduc

O

r
A\ U i i o iy

r

[ S WP © i S W

n o

PR,
O T L_.LUJ.J.Q,

1 ey

alh o o

12 ~1

IS
VoITTI o T T oo gty

Iz

VCITTI O TS Y

PTroTCcC TTTCO T OT

o~ Al
oo C T

i
C

T

PSR I I X 2
AT 1L

rxzra o~
[ S v g

o
=}

P SR B SN B ~C I T B I B 1 ot g~
ESASAS L S mp AT R S 4w S mE aS = e XS —CCTTC

+ 1
CIT

+xz £+
O

oo T T Cy

O N~ o

WSR 22-02-040

Certified on 1/13/2022



Washington State Register

WSR 22-02-040

429.1 General.

The provisions of this section shall apply to the con-

struction of new buildings and accessory structures,

including parking

lots and parking garages.

Electric vehicle supply eguipment

(EVSE)

shall be installed in

accordance with applicable reguirements of chapter 19.28 RCW and the

National Electrical Code,

Article 625.

EXCEPTION:

Electric vehicle charging infrastructure is not required if any of the following conditions are met:

1. There is no public utility or commercial power supply.

2. Dwelling units without garages or other on-site parking.

429.2 Electric vehicle (EV) charging infrastructure.

Buildings and ac-

cessory structures shall be provided with EV charging stations,

EV-

Ready parking spaces,

and EV-capable parking spaces in accordance with

Table 429.2.

Calculations shall be rounded up to the nearest whole

number.

Where a building contains more than one occupancy,

the elec-

tric vehicle charging infrastructure percentages of Table 429.2 shall

be applied to the number of spaces required for each occupancy.

EXCEPTIONS:

comply with Section 429.2.

1. Except for Group A, Group E, and Group M occupancies, on-site parking with less than 10 parking spaces shall not be required to

2. Group A, Group E, and Group M occupancies shall comply with one of the following, whichever is greater:

2.1. The provisions of Section 429.2 shall apply only to designated employee parking spaces.
2.2. One of each 200 parking spaces or fraction thereof shall be EV Ready. One of each 200 parking spaces or fraction thereof shall be

an EV Charging Station.

Table 429.2

Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure

Occupancy

Number of EV
Charging Stations

Number of EV-Ready
Parking Spaces

Number of EV-Capable
Parking Spaces

Group A.B.E.F, H.I. M,

10% of total parking spaces

10% of total parking spaces

10% of total parking spaces

and S occupancies

Group R occupancies

private garages

Buildings that do not Not required One for each dwelling unit Not required
contain more than two

dwelling units

Dwelling units with Not required One for each dwelling unit Not required

All other Group R
occupancies

10% of total parking spaces

25% of total parking spaces

10% of total parking spaces

429.2.1 EV charging stations and EV-Ready parking spaces.

A minimum of

40-ampere dedicated 208/240-volt branch circuit shall be installed for

each EV Ready parking space and each EV Charging Station.

The branch

circuits shall terminate at a receptacle outlet or EV charger in close

proximity to the proposed location of the EV Ready parking space or

the EV Charging Station.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [

WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

429.2.2 EV-Capable parking spaces. A listed raceway capable of accom-
modating a minimum of 40-ampere dedicated 208/240-volt branch circuit
shall be installed for each EV-Capable parking space. The raceway
shall terminate into a cabinet, box or other enclosure in close prox-
imity to the proposed location of the EV-Capable parking space. Race-
ways and related components that are planned to be installed under-—
ground, and in enclosed, inaccessible or concealed areas and spaces,
shall be installed at the time of original construction.

429.3 Electrical room(s) and equipment. Electrical room(s) and/or
dedicated electrical equipment shall be sized to accommodate the re-
guirements of Section 429.

The electrical service and the electrical system, including any
on-site distribution transformer (s), shall have sufficient capacity to
simultaneously charge all EVs at all required EV Charging Stations, EV
Ready parking spaces, and EV-Capable parking spaces at a minimum of
40-amperes each.

EXCEPTION: Automatic Load Management System (ALMS) may be used to adjust the maximum electrical capacity required for the EV-Ready and
EV-Capable parking spaces. The ALMS must be designed to allocate charging capacity among multiple future EV Charging Stations at

a minimum of 16 amperes per EV charger.

429.4 Electric vehicle charging infrastructure for accessible parking
spaces. Ten percent of the accessible parking spaces, rounded to the
next whole number, shall be EV Charging Stations. Additional ten per-
cent of the accessible parking spaces, rounded to the next whole num-
ber, shall be EV Ready.

The electric vehicle charging infrastructure may also serve adja-
cent parking spaces not designated as accessible parking. A maximum of
ten percent of the accessible parking spaces, rounded to the next
whole number, are allowed to be included in the total number of elec-
tric vehicle parking spaces required under Section 429.3.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.077, 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR
21-16-063, § 51-50-0429, filed 7/29/21, effective 8/29/21.]

NEW SECTION

WAC 51-50-0430 Section 430—Recycled materials.

430 Recyclable materials, compost, and solid waste storage. Space
shall be provided for the storage of recycled materials, compost, and
solid waste for all new buildings.

EXCEPTION: Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies.

The storage area shall be designed to meet the needs of the occu-
pancy, efficiency of pickup, and be available to occupants and haul-
ers.

[]

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 33 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19,

7/1/20)

effective

WAC 51-50-0503 Section 503—General building height and area
limitations.

3 o N £ 1 axzal B S NI S NN £ o171 W
. . ~ . Fany [ S N [ S NSV VA N 7 t/UJ_ CTUTT CITCT 1T OO [SSJ5  § &> iy S =y T

noerma ol + =N mand e o oo A A £ v~z A+ T LN N £ +
b/ [ ) ) i S Wy oL R Ly \@ ) oL o LT Ay \Ab/_L oL [ S A N b/J_UV_L\A oL CTT Ay \Ab/ul.l _Y g CTT
>~ £ 1o AW EE LN NPT T~ SN SR BB - NP-NE S N I i I B S L LN 2N | S04 4 Ff~+r +1h ot~y
[ S A N = ) T A \Ab/ul.l _Y CITTO T = ) b/ [ ) i Sy oL LJ_Y T U e T [ S N CTT L.)L.,\JJ__Y
Tmmeda o+t ~ATsxz Il Ay 1 >~ + T ENEYNEN £ + 1 WL T LN N B fao abh17 ~A~+
LTTTT |\ N iy @ Ry w _L_Y Ly LTV CTT [E SNV N Sy T L& g = (=5 g CTT Ay \Ab/_L oL [E SN AN g S ) [SSJ N I & Ry S IO T
b IR IR P B I N S 2N ittt T Aa ey o o -] b A TNy QN o n ENE
Py J S SR LAw oL J S CTT J\J\A_L_L\A_Ll.lv L& g = (=5 [ ) - vu_L(.AL., oL LJ_Y J CTUTT AV av)
EXCEPTIONS: e ed esa -

P ord 0

503.1.4.1 Enclosure of occupied roof areas. Elements or structures en-
closing the occupied roof areas shall not extend more than 48 inches
(1220 mm) above the surface of the occupied roof.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Penthouses constructed in accordance with Section 1511.2 and towers, domes, spires, and cupolas constructed in accordance with
Section 1511.5.

2. High rise buildings.

503.1.4.2 Guards.
Section 1015.2.

Occupied roofs shall have guards in accordance with

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0503, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0503, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 21-06-035, filed 2/23/21, effective
3/26/21)
WAC 51-50-0504 Section 504—Building height and number of sto-
ries.
Table 504.3
Allowable Building Height in Feet Above Grade Plane?
Type of Construction
o
Clasgitoation See Type I Type I1 Type I1I Type IV Type V
Footnotes | A B A B A B A B C | HT | A B
A,B,E,F,M, S, NSP UL 160 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
u S UL | 180 85 75 85 75 270 | 180 85 85 70 60
H-1, H-2, H-3, NSe.d UL | 160 65 55 65 55 120 90 65 65 50 40
H-5
S
H-4 NSe-d UL 160 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
S UL | 180 85 75 85 75 140 | 100 85 85 70 60
I-1 Condition 1, NSde UL | 160 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
-3 S UL | 180 85 75 85 75 180 | 120 85 85 70 60
I-1 Condition 2, Nsd.ef UL | 160 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
12 gi UL | 180 | 85
Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 34 WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Type of Construction

C(l)a?s'i’f‘-:é';%n See Type I Type 11 Type I1I Type IV Type V
Footnotes A B A B A B A B C HT A B
I-4 NSd-g UL | 160 | 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
S UL | 180 | 85 75 85 75 180 | 120 | 85 85 70 60
Rb Nsd UL | 160 | 65 55 65 55 65 65 65 65 50 40
S13D 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 50 40
S13R 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60 60
S UL | 180 | 85 75 85 75 | 270 | 180 | 85 85 70 60

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.
UL = Unlimited; NS = Buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system; S = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; S13R = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.2.
a See Chapters 4 and 5 for specific exceptions to the allowable height in this chapter.
See Section 903.2 for the minimum thresholds for protection by an automatic sprinkler system for specific occupancies.
New Group H occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.5.
The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building height in accordance with the International Existing Building Code.
New Group I-1 and I-3 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. For new Group
I-1 occupancies Condition 1, see Exception 1 of Section 903.2.6.
f New and existing Group I-2 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.6 and Section
1103.5 of the International Fire Code.
¢ For new Group I-4 occupancies, see Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section 903.2.6.
h New Group R occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.8.
i ]-1, Condition 2 Assisted living facilities licensed in accordance with chapter 388-78 A WAC and residential treatment facilities as licensed by
Washington state under chapter 246-337 WAC shall be permitted to use the allowable height above grade plane for Group R-2 occupancies.

Table 504.4
Allowable Number of Stories Above Grade Plane?'®

o a o o

Type of Construction
C(l)acscslilfl-:;:lggn See Type I Type IT Type I1I Type IV Type V
Footnotes A B A B A B A B C HT A B
A-1 NS UL 5 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 2 1
S UL 6 4 3 4 3 9 6 4 4 3 2
A-2 NS UL 11 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 2 1
S UL 12 4 3 4 3 18 12 6 4 3 2
A-3 NS UL 11 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 2 1
S UL 12 4 3 4 3 18 12 6 4 3 2
A-4 NS UL 11 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 2 1
S UL 12 4 3 4 3 18 12 6 4 3 2
A-5 NS UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL 1 1 1 UL | UL | UL
S uL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL | UL
B NS UL 11 5 3 5 3 5 5 5 5 3 2
S UL 12 6 4 6 4 18 12 9 6 4 3
E NS UL 5 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 1 1
S UL 4 3 4 3 9 6 4 4 2 2
F-1 NS UL 11 4 2 3 2 3 3 3 4 2 1
S UL 12 5 3 4 3 10 7 5 5 3 2
F-2 NS UL 11 5 3 4 3 5 5 5 5 3 2
S UL 12 6 4 5 4 12 8 6 6 4 3
H-1 NSe.d 1 1 1 1 1 1 NP | NP | NP 1 1 NP
S 1 1 1
H-2 NSe.d UL 3 2 1 2 1 1 1 1 2 1 1
S 2 2 2

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 35 ] WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Type of Construction
C?acscs'i’f‘-:é';ggn See Type I Type 11 Type I1I Type IV Type V
Footnotes A B A B A B A B C HT A B
H-3 NSed UL 6 4 2 4 2 3 3 3 4 2 1
S 4 4 4
H-4 NSed UL 7 5 5 5 2
S UL 8 8 7 6 6
H-5 NSe&d 4 3 3 3 3 2 2 2 3 3
S 3 3 3
I-1 Condition 1 NSde UL 9 4 4 4 4 4 4 2
S UL 10 5 4 10 7 5 4
I-1 Condition 2 NSde UL 9 4 3 3 3 3 3 3
Si UL 10 5 10 6 4
I-2 NSd.f UL 4 2 1 1 NP | NP | NP | NP 1 1 NP
S UL 5 3 7 5 1
I-3 NSde UL 4 2 1 2 1 2 2 2 2 2 1
S UL 5 3 2 3 2 7 5 3 3 3 2
I-4 NSd-g UL 5 3 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 1 1
S UL 6 4 3 4 3 9 6 4 4 2 2
M NS UL 11 4 2 4 2 4 4 4 4 3 1
S UL 12 5 3 5 3 12 8 6 5 4 2
R-1h Nsd UL 11 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 3 2
S13R 4 4 4 3
S UL 12 5 5 5 5 18 12 8 5 4 3
R-2h Nsd UL 11 4 4 4 4 4 3 2
S13R 4 4 4 4 3
S UL 12 5 5 5 5 18 12 8 5 4 3
R-3h Nsd UL 11 4 4 4 3 3
S13D 4 4 3 3
S13R 4 4 4 4
S UL 12 5 5 5 5 18 12 5 5 4 4
R-4h Nsd UL 11 4 4 4 4 4 4 3 2
S13D 4 4 3 2
S13R 4 4 4 3
S UL 12 5 5 5 5 18 12 5 5 4 3
S-1 NS UL 11 4 2 3 2 4 4 4 4 3 1
S UL 12 5 3 4 3 10 7 5 5 4 2
S-2 NS UL 11 5 3 4 3 4 4 4 4 4 2
S UL 12 6 4 5 4 12 8 5 5 5 3
U NS UL 5 4 2 3 2 4 4 4 4 2 1
S UL 6 5 3 4 3 9 6 5 5 3 2

UL = Unlimited; NP = Not permitted; NS = Buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system; S = Buildings equipped throughout with
an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; S13R = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2.

a  See Chapters 4 and 5 for specific exceptions to the allowable height in this chapter.

b See Section 903.2 for the minimum thresholds for protection by an automatic sprinkler system for specific occupancies.

¢ New Group H occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.5.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 36 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

d The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building height in accordance with the International Existing Building Code.

¢ New Group I-1 and I-3 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. For new Group
I-1 occupancies Condition 1, see Exception 1 of Section 903.2.6.

f New and existing Group I-2 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.6 and Section
1103.5 of the International Fire Code.

g For new Group I-4 occupancies, see Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section 903.2.6.

h New Group R occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.2.8.
i Group I-1, Condition 2 Assisted living facilities licensed in accordance with chapter 388-78 A WAC and residential treatment facilities as licensed by
Washington state under chapter 246-337 WAC shall be permitted to use the allowable number of stories for Group R-2 occupancies.

504.4.1 Stair enclosure pressurization increase. For Group R-1, R-2,
and I-1 Condition 2 Assisted living facilities licensed under chapter
388-78A WAC and residential treatment facilities as licensed by Wash-
ington state under chapter 246-337 WAC located in buildings of Type VA
construction equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, the maximum number of
stories permitted in Section 504.4 may be increased by one provided
the interior exit stairways and ramps are pressurized in accordance
with Sections 909.6.3 and 909.20. Legally required standby power shall
be provided in accordance with Sections 909.11 and ((2702-2-36))
2702.17 for buildings constructed in compliance with this section and
be connected to stairway shaft pressurization equipment, elevators and
lifts used for accessible means of egress (if provided), elevator
hoistway pressurization equipment (if provided) and other life safety
equipment as determined by the authority having jurisdiction. For the
purposes of this section, legally required standby power shall comply
with 2020 NEC Section 701.12, options (C), (D), (E), (F), (H) or (J)
or subsequent revised section number (s).

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 21-06-035, §
51-50-0504, filed 2/23/21, effective 3/26/21; WSR 20-21-021, §
51-50-0504, filed 10/9/20, effective 11/9/20; WSR 20-01-090, S
51-50-0504, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0504, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0504, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0504, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: Chap-
ter 19.27 RCW. WSR 10-24-059, § 51-50-0504, filed 11/29/10, effective
7/1/11.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-0505 ((Reserwved:)) Section 0505—Mezzanines and equip-
ment platforms.

505.1 General. Mezzanines shall comply with Section 505.2. Eguipment
platforms shall comply with Section 505.3.

EXCEPTION: Lofts in Group R occupancy dwelling units and sleeping units shall be permitted to comply with Section 420.13, subject to the

limitations in Section 420.13.1.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0505, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0505, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16.]

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 37 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-01-090, filed 12/12/19, effective
7/1/20)

WAC 51-50-0506 ((Seetion506—Building area-)) Reserved.

( (Pable—506-2
_II I 4
InSquare Feetd-R
Fype-of Construetion
cpceupaney | see Typed Typell Type HI TypetV Type ¥
A B A B A B A B € | HF | A B
A+ NS | BE | UL | 155600 | 8500 | 14,000 | 8500 | 45000 | 30,000 | 18750 | 156000 | H5500 | 5500
St UL | UL | 62000 | 34000 | 56:000 | 34000 | 50,000 | 120:000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46:000 | 22,000
SM | BE | BE | 46500 | 25500 | 425000 | 25500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 450600 | 34500 | 16500
A2 NS | BE | BE | 15500 | 9500 | 14,000 | 9,500 | 45,000 | 30,000 | 18,750 | 15;000 | 1500 | 6,000
St UL | UL | 62000 | 35000 | 56000 | 38.000 | 80,000 | 120.000 | 75,000 | 60,000 | 46:000 | 24.000
SM | BE | BE | 46,500 | 28,500 | 42,000 | 28,500 | 135,000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 45,000 | 34,500 | 18,000
A3 NS | BE | BE | 15500 | 95500 | 14,000 | 9,500 | 45,000 | 30,000 | 18,750 | 15000 | 1500 | 6,000
St UL | UL | 62,000 | 35000 | 56:000 | 38000 | 450,000 | 120:000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46:000 | 24000
SM | BE | BE | 46500 | 28,500 | 425000 | 28500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 45000 | 34500 | 13000
A4 NS | BE | HE | 15560 | 9500 | 14,000 | 9,500 | 45000 | 30,000 | 18750 | 15600 | H5500 | 6,000
St UL | UL | 62,000 | 35000 | 56:000 | 35.000 | 150,000 | 120:000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46:000 | 24000
SM | BE | BE | 46500 | 28,500 | 425000 | 28500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 45000 | 34500 | 18000
A5 NS | BE | B | B | B | B | B | B | B | B | B | BV | BE
St
SM
B NS | BE | BE | 37500 | 23,000 | 28500 | 19;000 | 108,000 | 72,000 | 45000 | 36,000 | 18,000 | 9,000
St UL | UL | 150000 | 92,000 | 114000 | 76000 | 432,000 | 255.000 | 180.000 | +44.000 | 72,000 | 36:000
SM | UL | UL | 12500 | 69000 | 85500 | 57,000 | 324000 | 216,000 | 135000 | 105,000 | 54060 | 27,600
E NS | BE | BE | 26500 | 14,500 | 23;500 | 14,500 | 76,500 | 51000 | 31875 | 25500 | 18,560 | 9,500
St UL | UL | 106000 | 55000 | 94000 | 55.000 | 306,000 | 204:000 | 127,500 | 102,000 | 74:000 | 38:000
SM | UL | UL | 79500 | 43500 | 70,500 | 43:500 | 229,500 | 53,000 | 95625 | 76500 | 55500 | 28,500
-+ NS | BE | UE | 250600 | 15500 | 19000 | 12,000 | 106,500 | 67000 | 41875 | 33500 | 14000 | &500
St UL | UL | 100000 | 62,000 | 76:000 | 45:000 | 402,000 | 265:000 | 167,500 | 134000 | 56:000 | 34000
SM | UL | UL | 75000 | 46500 | 57,000 | 36:000 | 304500 | 204000 | 125,625 | 100:500 | 42,000 | 25500
B2 NS | UL | Ob | 37500 | 23.000 | 25500 | 48,000 | 155,500 | 01000 | 63425 | 50.500 | 21000 | 43000
St UL | UL | 150000 | 52,000 | 114000 | 72.000 | 606:000 | 404:000 | 252,500 | 202.000 | $4:000 | 52,000
SM | Uk | UL | H2.500 | 69000 | 85500 | 54000 | 454500 | 303,000 | 189375 | 151500 | 63,000 | 39,000
fraes NSE | 21000 | 46500 | 1000 | 7000 | 9500 | 7000 | 10,500 | 10,500 | 40,000 | 10500 | 7500 | NP
St
St
SM
H-3 NS¢ | BE | 66,000 | 26,500 | 14,000 | 17500 | 1350600 | 25;500 | 25500 | 25500 | 25,500 | 10,000 | 55000
St
SM
H-4 Nsed | BE | BE | 374500 | 15500 | 28,500 | 175500 | 72,000 | 54,000 | 46,500 | 36,000 | 18,000 | 6,500
H-S Nsed | BE | BE | 37500 | 23,000 | 23,500 | 19,000 | 72,000 | 54,000 | 46,500 | 36,000 | 18,000 | 9,600
St BE | YE | 156,000 | 92,600 | 114000 | 76,000 | 283,000 | 216,000 | 162,000 | 144;0060 | 72,000 | 36,000
SM | UE | UL | H2:500 | 65000 | 85500 | 57,000 | 216,000 | 162,000 | 121,500 | 105:000 | 54000 | 27,000

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 38 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Fype-of- Construetion
opeeupaney | See Typel Type H Type Typedv Type V
A B A B A B A B € | HF | A B
f Nobe | UL | 55000 | 19:000 | 10000 | 16:500 | +0:000 | 54000 | 36:000 | 48,000 | 15,000 | $0.500 | 4500
1-2 NSdf | BE | BE | 15000 | 15000 | 12,000 | NP | 36,000 | 24,000 | 12,000 | 12,000 | 95500 | NP
St UL | BE | 60,000 | 44000 | 48,000 | NP | 144,000 | 96.000 | 48.000 | 48.000 | 38.000 | NP
SM | UL | UL | 45000 | 33.000 | 36000 | NP | 108,000 | 72,000 | 36.000 | 36.000 | 28500 | NP
3 Nsbe | UE | UL | 15:000 | 0000 | 10:500 | 7500 | 36:000 | 24:000 | 42000 | 12000 | 7500 | 5000
St UL | BE | 45000 | 40,000 | 42.000 | 30.000 | 144000 | 96.000 | 48.000 | 48.000 | 30.000 | 20.000
SM | UE | UL | 45000 | 30,000 | 31500 | 22500 | 108,000 | 72.000 | 36,000 | 36,000 | 22,500 | 15.000
M NS | BE | HUE | 25560 | 125500 | 18500 | 12,500 | 61500 | 415000 | 25625 | 20500 | 14000 | 9,000
St | UE | UL | 86000 | 50000 | 74,000 | 50.000 | 246:000 | 164,000 | 102,500 | 82,000 | 56:000 | 36,000
SM_ | UL | UL | 64500 | 37,500 | 55,500 | 37,500 | 184,500 | 123,000 | 76875 | 65500 | 42:000 | 27,000
Rt NSl | UE | UL | 24000 | 16000 | 24000 | 16:000 | 61500 | 45000 | 25625 | 20,500 | 12:000 | 7000
SR
St | UE | UL | 96000 | 64000 | 96000 | 64000 | 246:000 | 164,000 | 102,500 | 82,000 | 43:000 | 28,000
SM | UL | UL | 72,000 | 45,000 | 72,000 | 43,000 | 184,500 | 123,000 | 76875 | 65500 | 36:000 | 24000
SR
st UL | 96000 | 64000 | 96,000 | 64,000 | 246,000 | +64:000 | 162,500 | 82,000 | 45,000 | 28:000
R-3h Ned | BB | BE | BE | BE | BE | BE | BE | BE | BE | B | BV | BE
S13D
SH3R
St
SM
Rl NSl | U | UL | 24000 | 16:000 | 24000 | 16,000 | 65500 | 45000 | 25:625 | 20500 | 12.000 | 7000
S3b
SR
St | UE | UL | 96000 | 64000 | 96,000 | 64000 | 246:000 | 164,000 | 102,500 | 82,000 | 48:000 | 28,000
SM_ | UL | UL | 72,000 | 48,000 | 72,000 | 43.000 | 184,500 | 123,000 | 76875 | 65500 | 36:000 | 24000
S+ NS | UE | 48,000 | 26,000 | 17500 | 26;000 | 15500 | 76;500 | 55000 | 35875 | 25500 | 14,000 | 9,000
S-2 NS | UL | 79.000 | 39,000 | 26,000 | 39,000 | 26.000 | 115500 | 77.000 | 48125 | 38,500 | 21000 | 13.500
St | UE | 3H6:000 | 156,000 | 104,000 | +56.000 | 104,000 | 462:000 | 308,000 | 192,500 | 154,000 | 84000 | 54000
U NSi | UL | 35500 | 19000 | 8500 | 14000 | 8500 | 54000 | 36000 | 22,500 | 18:000 | 9:000 | 53500

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 39 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0506, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0506, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0506, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0506, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0506, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-0506¢6,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 19-02-038, filed 12/26/18, effective
7/1/19)

WAC 51-50-0508 Section 508—Mixed use and occupancy.

H a
o 11t —

Ay o T (&8

| o o + o
£ ENEPN r R o1 S aa T
[ S — (&8 - - i A CT T (@ e rw) LTt A\ o (&8 =) N
TR r T Aom ot e ~E o AT T o Foad £ +1 A S r £+
LV 1 L . LV C Ul T OO T TIOUIT [ J5 N Iy & R Sy Py =) b/LA.J_LA.L_ A8 1T OTIT CITT LT C - L . L CTT
wAw O PO e & e ShH - & RO
1 /2 2~k (12 7 o\ szt s o o ] EP S NN SIP NE I PN B S SN SR PN S NP= S~ B SN

- - LTI T L& T Uty \j_yt./u\_,uu P WAL ® I SR W § L . (&8 T T [ S iy @ Ry CIITTACT ) T [ A8 S S (&

PN NN PICIE A T SNEP NP R o+ PP SN PN I NSRS £ T~ [ LIS NN
\NAU N B W N @ i i By W I CTT AT TIT ) CITT oo b/k_ull\_/ - L 1T 1T L OO0 CTT CTT . J.le/ 1=
oo [ LEENPP NN PPV P NE NI Ll P Moot =~ + 1 Tttty T2 o0 Tt £ NEPA 278
C T LT 1T OTToIT oo U1 L 11 N [ - T CITT [ S A A \jJ__LL__Y L 11 N [ - A . N L LT IT°Y T T e

508.5.1 Limitations. The following shall apply to live/work areas:

1. The live/work unit is permitted to be not greater than 3,000
square feet (279 m) in area.

2. The nonresidential area is permitted to be not more than 50
percent of the area of each live/work unit.

3. The nonresidential area function shall be limited to the first
or main floor only of the live/work unit.

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0508, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 19-02-038, filed 12/26/18, effective
7/1/19)

WAC 51-50-0509 Section 509—Incidental uses.

ENE i PN rood b o~ ot a2 maca + 2ol lementa oz e o
T [ S - o o CTTT =T oL =] t/(_A.J_(_A.L_,_L\JJ.J., TITTOO WO C I - - TTT TT TS =] J_V_LJ.J.\-j (&)
£ barr-o E EN NN I G~ S~aanamin] g 4 Micgon T -R v TN AN e g
[ S N & N SR S 10 A (&N T O T 1T 27 OTT CT T (& ey ll.lJ\J_L_Y LI J__Yt/ LV 17 7 LV UTIT oS T CT
Faorn a1 P NENE PN S B S 2SN~ 2 EIRAE —NE N ~ £ + 1 AW I AT SN | o w1 +h
CITUTT [ W I & Ry S Ly =] t/(_A.J_(_A.L_, oL 1T OUTIT CTT LT C [ S N g CTT i S W ITTTCCT T \@ ) W LT CITT
PN N PNE P T = I = B e N SN v NS o E N N IR N I OO E P2 £ 1 /2 3o~ (12 7
TT (.A.t/t/J_\JV oL CTT [ S Y § 6P [\ & NN S S - UThOo 155 L_,_LJ.J.\-j . (& T T T TTTITOTIT . L7 i S T \J_ T
aa oy - o - o aa =) 1 o ) o ) 1

VP O &—o o

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 40 ] WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

m + o + 1 N P I N Ny v £ + 1 + 1 T Aarmr, vt a1 My crma oo o n
ITT ) CIT (& R b/k_ull\_/ o L LT C 1 Tk A\ PNV AND L U CIT . lllb/ L C T [ S S @ R A YWD N ) ) AP SN RN N S N i
e T ot ~ A + 1 T+ PRI 2 a T ot £ NITDA 278 ))
L 11 . o O [P ELw § CIT [ S i \jJ.J.L__Y L 11 . o O A\ N L LT ITYX 1T I

Table 509

Incidental Uses

Separation and/or

Room or Area

Protection

Dry type transformers over
112.5 kVA and required to

1 hour or provide
automatic sprinkler system

be in a fire resistant room
per NEC (NFPA 70)

Section 450.21 (B)!
I Dry type transformers rated over 35,000 volts and oil-insulated

transformers shall be installed in a transformer vault complying with
NFPA 70.

(Remainder of table unchanged)

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0509, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and chapters 19.27 and 34.05 RCW. WSR 13-04-067, §
51-50-0509, filed 2/1/13, effective 7/1/13. Statutory Authority: RCW
19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 10-03-097, § 51-50-0509, filed 1/20/10,
effective 7/1/10. Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.074, 19.27.020, and
chapters 70.92, 19.27, and 34.05 RCW. WSR 07-01-091, § 51-50-0509,
filed 12/19/06, effective 7/1/07.]

AMENDATORY SECTION
11/9/20)

(Amending WSR 20-21-021, filed 10/9/20, effective

WAC 51-50-0510 Section 510—Special provisions.

510.2 Horizontal building separation allowance. A building shall be
considered as separate and distinct buildings for the purpose of de-
termining area limitations, continuity of fire walls, limitation of
number of stories and type of construction where ((at+—-e£)) the fol-
lowing conditions are met:

1. The buildings are separated with a horizontal assembly having
a fire-resistance rating of not less than 3 hours. Where vertical off-
sets are provided as part of a horizontal assembly, the vertical off-
set and the structure supporting the vertical offset shall have a
fire-resistance rating of not less than 3 hours.

2. The building below, including the horizontal assembly, is of
Type IA construction.

3. Shaft, stairway, ramp and escalator enclosures through the
horizontal assembly shall have not less than a 2-hour fire-resistance
rating with opening protective in accordance with Section 716.

EXCEPTION:

Where the enclosure walls below the horizontal assembly have not less than a 3-hour fire-resistance rating with opening protectives in
accordance with Section 716, the enclosure walls extending above the horizontal assembly shall be permitted to have a 1-hour fire-
resistance rating provided that the following conditions are met:

1. The building above the horizontal assembly is not required to be of Type I construction.

2. The enclosure connects fewer than four stories; and

3. The enclosure opening protective above the horizontal assembly have a fire protection rating of not less than 1 hour.

((43n

Certified on 1/13/2022 WSR 22-02-040



Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

4. Interior exit stairways located within the Type IA building
are permitted to be of combustible materials where both of the follow-
ing requirements are met:

4.1. The building above the Type IA building is of Type III, IV,
or V construction.

4.2. The stairway located in the Type IA building is enclosed by
3-hour fire-resistance-rated construction with opening protectives in
accordance with Section 716.

5. The building or buildings above the horizontal assembly shall

be permitted to have ((mutEtipte)) Group A ( (eceupaney—uses;—each—with

PSS EENE RN

HH
R
B

(OR

& —or—Group—B—Greup
sed—eare—faeitities)), B, M, R, or S occupancies.
((5=)) 6. The building below the horizontal assembly shall be
protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system in ac-
cordance with Section 903.3.1.1, and shall be permitted to be any oc-

cupancy allowed by this code except Group H.

((6=)) 7. The maximum building height in feet (mm) shall not ex-
ceed the limits set forth in Section 504.3 for the building having the
smaller allowable helght as measured from the grade plane (Greup

P S | SN
b/ T

.~
L
N

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 20-21-021, §
51-50-0510, filed 10/9/20, effective 11/9/20; WSR 20-01-090, §
51-50-0510, filed 12/12/19, effective 7/1/20; WSR 16-03-064, §
51-50-0510, filed 1/19/16, effective 7/1/16.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 19-02-038, filed 12/26/18, effective
7/1/19)

WAC 51-50-0601 ((Seetien601—General-)) Reserved.

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 42 ] WSR 22-02-040




Washington State Register WSR 22-02-040

Ll I sV o

))

[Statutory Authority: RCW 19.27.031 and 19.27.074. WSR 19-02-038, §
51-50-0601, filed 12/26/18, effective 7/1/19.]

AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 20-21-021, filed 10/9/20, effective
11/9/20)

WAC 51-50-0602 Section 602—Construction classification.
( (Pable—602

Certified on 1/13/2022 [ 43 ] WSR 22-02-040



WSR 22-02-040

Washington State Register

S
T T
Ikl

N oaming o+ 21T
A4 115 A & i g s e

TIOTT

n

SN

1 m
C I

o maao  +

man

ittt 1 A9 -~
oo oG

T ok +1
T

wh

s

T

TITChO O

TIrCo oL

33

T

C

T

Wt

+h Mol

WL CIT

oo Ao~ T
O Cott

n

T

1oy

ot
J_(/LL,_LLJ.\j\)

+ o

oq oo

AP v mary

T OO T

Tt

-

O Lo ol

o

T

N
CIttio

T

[Cryaws

=}

T

B W S N I T B 2

ot

+ o

oq oo

o ok~

TTCTOo

m

TTT

o

Moo

o

TrToCcTity

CIT e g O Lo ol

TTT

[ ¥y & ngm mpm m

1
11

jar i yeyw)

1 ey

ot

+ o

oq oo

+h

ERP N,
CIT

bhaoaoand AN

n
CTOTT

o

maon

It

O
n +
O

J_(/LL,_LLJ.\j
+ 1

1

comh

O Lo Coll
=

=
N

-
1 m
C I

T
maacco

T CrIt
+ 1

CIT

LCAC TS AAw S )
nir ot n

CT—tiio—S
neominia o 21T
ot

TTCTOo
n

+h

O Tt Cc T OUTT

4
+h a
W LT CITT
I S B

TIrT - C T

IS A C T OTTy TITChO O =

oo TS T TiIo T

CIT

baoth
oOoTTT

n 702 2
cTOTT
1

o
[ e ny @ pm =y

AN~ T
O Cott

oo

n

rm g
Tttt

12N
0

a1 1

an A

T e
L

7

4

A i

(=T 3 S i i & g m

1 ey

14

N

TOrr oIty

£

-

+

and o o

n o

N

TTo OIS
+h + 1

WL CIT

Aiman o

ma o g i

T T T CITC Ot

Iy
a1 1

TIT

m

702 2

— O

e ©

N
CIIrTo

A=

I &

O CItT

T e D .

7

T~ T2 A0
T CTotTrS
~ oA TN (™

n

N

1+ o
Ao cTOTT
£ Mxzn I‘f ]

A\

n o

o2
TS OIS

Brotr
PEo

CIT

TA73

ooty
Moo o

+ o ocominT <z
oo ot

m
TTT

TX T\
T

fal
=}

nt o

m

IaN

1 m
C I

+

11

2204

n
CTOTT

OTT

v

v I ED A & i % 1\ W e

Xy

\4

A
neoamingg o4+
TTOTT

TTICTOo

+
WL CIT

TTT

T

TITHS O
ah 11

DU T e L L.

n Al 2 ~A
PP
g g

ot

RN

111

oot o T Tio T

n

TA73

ot A

R

12N
o

n

N

cTOTT
o+ 1 <7

gt~
o OO

<

CTOTT

PToT
ot

A=

C

IS A

[ ¥} & npm mpm m

n o

N

cC O o

T+ (@
W I CTt

AN~ T
oGttt

oo

SN

1 m
C I

+

ma ooy

+h
(o

4

Ol SO

+

+
|\ g

\PAv)

4

p

TITChO O

O
LEP= S AT ALS)

cTy

n

ot

N ominga o+ 21T nr
o CoOmMoosTTTo=T

n
ot

EN I T I +h
oo T 9T Tt
+ 1 (@

Wttt

m
C It

o

CcCTOTT

IS A

cO

A=

TIT

|2 P EERCACAT b v vy

alh 11

1+
W Ctt

come sz

702 Q oA
Trr

n

TA 73

AN~
O Cott

oo

o o
Tttt

12N
o

O Ty

OO e O

CTOTT

4

A,

A=

[ ¥y & nym mpm m

n 22202 1

o 1

DU T e L e T

CTOTT

\%4

)

neomihia o 21T oot g~ o
Omo o Tt ToT OrrocroaCTcTOTr=

TIOTT

n

12N
o

a1 1

+
O

B N S S S
C LTI - UTIT o T T La—LVLJ-’

A\

[ ¥ Y & g mpm m

I oo

+ 1
o TrrCTTw ST

el

t/\_,J_ul_l_tt\_,d A3 C\_,pt

rrm

Nt o
ITOT

+

=
(&

o

P TN

=

neo

o

1

N

O o CcrroTrT COTTCTTO Tt opaocTtTo

Comihitaot

i

TOO

oy
oT/—COTT

Nt
ITOT

n akho1 1

N

noat o~
\AU S ¥ D S Ry w i W e mp i 8

I~

Py

T

£ Mz
O

ol 1 o

£

2 o+

1

+1hh 1
WL CITTIT LT LT9YIirc

TATT

[ I & gm mpm my

WTr T O

[ a5 1 3 A

1T o oo+l oo PSWtE
CcCOoOIToCc ot T O W CIt oTTT™

noat o~

o

N

S A TX7

7\ T 7P
T
+h o

1

T

it 1 A2 e~ £ Mz~
oo o9 s OT

T

LT

T

T

=7
JL £

7

v

Ty PP<

ot e
O CTo Tt

TTT

+
S S g i g

NN

oo <z

TTOoOwC o T T veT
190 £
T

3z

SN
(S5 CAw A~

+

+

+
- OO0

3

O
+

CIICT
ot

o L C°TT

CIIort

o=

I

Iz

+

12
T

1337 -~

3

= Al
|SA e S AT e mp S A e ap e A 2y ¥ T |

PETES
bl

oo

=

n

doer g ritm

(S v T T T T ooTvT

O

O C O TTO

T T T oSOy

(=) e = ap e gy e

o

n
A\ ¥ A e mp v

»+ Tt ettty

<zt

oI T vacoT

S

+

N

T

+

N

+
TIrc T O

heor - -~+
CTItiot =Tt

FER I

N1 o ma o

araA

ITO TS TWO y

&N
\SAY,

C

A3

TITho O

gTTooucTT pTraltcy

n

ot

1+ <
W I CIt

S A S 173
o CTOTToOIrCcT

n

akh11 W nrat st A

o

Q13

g

e I e L o

o T TITOIT

T proco T T To oIt

[ i & gm mpm my

[ AW I Sy )
s

n
TITrCT

oA nlan

190 £ + I~z
—CcCT

T

ot~

12
T
K

13 mnera A~ r o

N

PO OIS

ooV CT grroucT pTralicy

ah~11
[ % 4 & nu mpu m

(S v

CIIort o COoOL TCTo O

SRR

not raa o~ A A

o
o COoOIrTo ot Tttt —OT

=N

o

Q13

neo

17
TCIICToOoOrrTo

3

ITO T o TWO y

+

trot

oI T vacorT

S

s
J

+
A3

o
= O

na 0D
\SAY,

N

ot
oo T TITUITo

+1 <
WL CLtL

S A S 173
o CTOTTOIrCcT

n

1 at oA
. S = B O e S S ) ) a3

B2

chHr oo oo T T e L. O
1

O SO
mlni o+

Ay

Nt o

m

N

ToTrCcommoTa o Cc o T CTITITTCOo

ne

n

1 ey

ot

PSR I~ RN
rTC oo tTcarrct

PSR BV R = o~
oot

+

[Cryaws

A\

o CcIITy

S S s i g

T

~n TN 2

ot
[CAT AR e Wy

n TN D

ot
[CAT AR e Wy

TT O e T

O

T .

r 1311 o

v

z+

£~
[ Sy & B WP g

A

N

11t o
TIITC Cucorac

¢
E

A\

cCC T O WTr T O

A3

C T O1Il

akh 11

R | OOTTIA YT o~
JA S = =
+

+

o
cC T TOT

+ 1

mmyaoanant o
N4 111 SATE S A= ¥ Ry

o

Ten 7292 77 1

ot
[CAT AR e W

[ I & gm mpm

oz

OV Ty

A\ 5 1 i S
N
TR TTPET

1L L
1

mlni o+

7

=

1 ey

] r o

bharr

313z

IS =]
TC oo Cc T ve oot tTT o

r

LRIV

mat gt o]
[ § & B UL Wi SR Sy @ R )

N
TToOTTrC oMo T o C T ioTTT

ne

n

ooV iy o

W C T T

oT—OT

r oo
o ER e ye)

45N
TOU

A

N

nad
N2 Al U S ) S ) v = A A

Nz

= am

= A

oo
ER e ye)

£ 20

A 2~ A
oSpPpTrCat——1ac

Qe

OO

oI o

[ = =

WSR 22-02-040

Certified on 1/13/2022



WSR 22-02-040

Washington State Register

ndad £

+

1
LTI C

Nne o4+ +ha~len oo
[cnw

PR IR
SPC T

n
O OTT

ah 11 1 o

ot

J 3 W i WPl W s W

[(oye)
i

T

CIT T CISTIT

CIT

TS
4+
AT aC

CcOoOTTIaOTtTT

(S 3§ & i mys S )

C

ot ot
aC

oA

a
T T

EEE |

=

n

4

o] oA
|\ S ITCTOOCITOUTT

=3

4

r
T T2 0O0Irca L

o

13

TaoTraolrtrc T

C

LT

CIT

’

| yw)

£ N 1T/
UL [SAV)

NVV/ 11T

o A
(S ravs

a1l 1 o

+
T

SN

1 m
CTIo

r oo b

T O

o

n
TIho L

+ 1

T T
TrC oty

nt o

m

It

WTr T O

TICho O

Tt 1=

CIT

TSy

iy NARS BN

n
CTOTT

T e T .

7

[ N &P BN N
£ ot

A\

Tala]

Tmea Saaad e~ o
S oS oS CC—I 1t

+
C LTIIT

r o
T —Crrctt

-
T
+h o

o
T E=

+
cOoO—COT

\.1uu_|_
et

2
CTIIT
1 (1)

oJ_\J_/,

o

o

-

N

r
[ ey @ o my

2 et

QN M
O

722 7

[CTyawd

T T
Toln]

T 1T

CIITrt U I Iiracco

C IIroCc TTToo

Ewaws

7

1 (20

722 7

n
It

o

N

T 1O C

n o

N

Tnpad

N

n aoannt »
OrrcEr oo cTTOIto
g f£

nir ot o

r oA~ g xg
pm e iy =]

+ 1

T T

A=

CTOTT

IS A

|wwn

CIT

alh 11

mn ] 3 e~ a1+l QA n 7299 7 1
OftoT—Tott W I CTt cTOTT

o

o
o

i

12N
o

7

4

— O

cOoO— O

A=

T C T

[ i Y & gm mm my

SN

1 m
CTIno

+

ma oo

OOV
QN4
O

oo

n +ha ~len
Tt T

+h o

o
OO

n

matoara o
T T [ S Sy € Ry Y
i

T

TIICho O

CIT

alh 11

S A i T [y
+h QA+

WL CIT

o

CIITort

-

TIoT

N+ P
[N N ) 1) A A U WY oL TT
mih]

I
T OO0t

12N
©

n

T\ 13

AN~
O Cott

T ol IS oo
[ w3

n

N

[ S s i e s e

+

T TOTT \SZh SRS 5 ¥ & i g
Th

4

T OO0

e Walal 3
13 % 7 mpm

+

PR PNE
Csnavs
+1h N2

WL CIT

N

Nnem e amings o 2 1T mat e
7B 1§ B NV W SN ) WS S N T T [ S Ey 65 Ry Sy
ot~

1 + 1

coOP—O=T
ah 11

TOHo O

A\

T oL

1T

TIOTT

CIT

4
Ol SO0

oo Ao T
O Cott

n
i

nraot
IS A

\P AV

A=

C

)

[ i & igm mpm my

2N

min 4 a a1
oot ICS

Wl

~

o

PR,

N

~

n

N

TIrc T O

T

o

[ Y & ngm mpm

OO0

A
&N
\SAY,

oL TactTo

T

ot oA

+

PToT

n
It

r a3 oer o
TS

Iz

4
T e T .

+h CQAa~t 2~
W LT CTT
+ +

T\ 13

AN~
O Cott
+1 O o~

WL CIT

o

n
o

nxr

\

A
PEEEN

OO T
+ 1

CTOTT

4

C

=,
[ ) Spn =y & §

N

T To T

n
O OTT

N

rm
TIrT - C T

i

12N
©

alh 11

18
0

T\ 73

oA~
O Cott
+ 1

CIT

[ i 4 & igm mm

IO T T

mih ] <z

Walal

+

TOUTT oo CTIio Ty «

CIT

P E L NI EE B 2 2N B
O pPTr oo Iitg
+1h <
W I CTIt

nr ot

£ 0

B

T Ly

ahan g ~ o

m

ot g~
- (_A._L, TTT
++ A
[ ) i Sy

+h o

+

*
~ o~ A

+ 1
o CTT
Sy Lw
£
g

o

C T OTTy

IS A

e

Trorr

uwg

CIITort

C IO

o

TA13

AN~
oGttt
ah 11

o

niimao
TIOno

EN|

rm

nt

T

P I B X 22
AT 1

o

-

N

+
[ e iy @y my > J

o
T T

4

It

I [T
3

<
Mao~h

R

+ 1

73

melsz 1
COomMpPp Ty Wttt
nat a1t

o
OrIroc T ™

S A

OaAd
cCOoCCT

7

no

PN
1T ITT CC T ITOOC ITTUITO T

T+

+ 1

~ 0D
C Ot —9T

~ 11

(ST 7 AV S iy & gy mpm m

[ AR Y ¥ i & ¥ i g E Oy & e g

CIT

2|
IO

n

N

CcCTOTT

Comlihiradt 21T o
oo o T TIoT

n 71 Q

ot 2

oo £
O
alh 11

-1

o

-1

3 o nrosz

S ]

CTUTT L= S Ay
+
f/J_\JL.,

4

POV I oITUITS

PP+
e

J_\JJ_lI.l_LJ.J.\j

&0

A\CAv)

[ g g

n

ot 2

+h
W LT CTT

T\ 13

IS oo Ao~
O Cott

o

ot oA

R

12N
o

o

QN
o pPT™

n

CcCTOTT

4

(S ¥ 3 & g ngm m =

(& pum

e I e L o

SN

1 m
CTIo

+

£ oo

A\

o

m

+

= A
T

aho £+
[N 2N BN Ny & N Epy

oOTTT

712 SnA 77 Q
Sy Lw
alh 11

n o

N

CcC OIS

oo
&0
\SAY,

EEAWAWS | S ay W 5

O L

CIT

ot oA

TO %
12N
o

0

+h QA ~t 2~ Vil
W LT CTT e 1 o L e

oo Ao~ T
OoTTCott

n
o

nirot
P oT

o
TICTOo

m

CTOTT

4

C

[ i ¥ & gm mpm my

TTT

2

Vil
“r

EEP I AT ALS)]

+h

ne N2 4 2D
\SAY,
IS

ot 2

+h
W LT CTT

T\ 13

A~
CErCatt
o2

+ ot A n o
C— Tt
A F

R
IS A
1

\CAY v U e
maont o oo
A

TTT

cCr - OTgTT
]

T
E |

“T
ming o4
Omio o T TioT

o

- CTTUTThO
ot 2o~ £ -~

+ N

O Lo Coll

alh 11

31
e

C

P e T

TICho O

TICTOo

ot 2

A\ S A

T Cc Ty
